Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation
Mayor’s Conference Room
P RE 'C O U N C I L Municipal Building
M E ETI N G Monday, November 2, 2015

6:15 p.m.
MAYOR: STEPHEN J. GALLIHER MAYOR PRO-TEM: JO LYNN TURLEY
Work Session — 6:15 p.m.
1. Presentation — Building Code Updates (Andrew Burt, Presenter)
Committee Meetings — Immediately following work session
PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE Russell Driskell, Chair
Police and Fire Vicky Collins, Vice Chair

1. Review Ordinance amending the budget for the Fiscal Year 2015-2016 (staffing at the Animal Shelter).

PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE Tolbert Rowe, Chair
Public Works, Water Pollution Control, “Don Meier, Vice Chair
Community Development, Water, Parks,

Airport, Cemeteries and Community Center

1. Review Proposal and Staff Recommendation for an Airport Consultant for the Sedalia Regional Airport.

2. Review Bids for Rock.

3. Review Ordinance accepting a quit claim deed for sections of Main Street and Oak Grove Lane and
accepting said streets for city maintenance to the City of Sedalia, Missouri from the County of Pettis,
Missouri.

4. Review quote from JCI Industries for the sole source purchase of a flight motor and gearbox for the
mixer at the Southeast Wastewater Treatment Plant in the amount of $21,489.00.

5. Review Bids for the Demolition of Structures located at 1520 South Vermont, 528 North Washington,
705 West 11" and 416 East 2™,

6. Review Bids & Ordinance approving and accepting an agreement by and between the City of Sedalia,
Missouri and APAC-Missouri, Inc. for the Mill and Overlay of South Madison Avenue from Highway 50
to 16™ Street in the City of Sedalia, Missouri. ,

7. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article IV of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia
relating to building codes (1* Reading; 2nd Reading to occur 90 days after)

8. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VII electrical code of the Code of Ordinances of the
City of Sedalia (1* Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)

9. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article V Existing Building Code of the Code of Ordinances of
the City of Sedalia (1* Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)

10.Review Ordinance amendmg Chapter 24, Article II Fire Prevention Code of the Code of Ordinances of
the City of Sedalia (1% Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)

11.Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VI Mechanical Code of the Code of Ordinances of the

City of Sedalia (1% Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)
12.Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VIII Plumbing and Gas Code of the Code of
Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (1% Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)

13. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article X, Division 2 International Property Maintenance Code

of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (1* Reading; 2" Reading to occur 90 days after)



jmyers
Text Box
Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation 


Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation

FINANCE/ADMINISTRATION COMMITTEE James Cunningham, Chair
Administrative, Library and Hospital Bonita Nash, Vice Chair

1. Review Ordinance calling a General Election to be held on April 5, 2016 for the purposé of
electing a Municipal Judge and one Councilman from each of the four wards in the City of

Sedalia, Missouri.
2. Review Records Destruction Request from the Personnel Department.

IF YOU HAVE SPECIAL NEEDS, WHICH REQUIRE ACCOMMODATION, PLEASE
NOTIFY THE CITY CLERK’S OFFICE. ACCOMMODATIONS WILL BE MADE FOR

YOUR NEEDS.


jmyers
Text Box
Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation 


Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation
CITY COUNCIL N
MEETING AGENDA M"“day’;‘fg;‘;‘f‘,ﬁf’ 22015

A. SILENT PRAYER & PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

B. ROLL CALL

C. SERVICE AWARDS

1. Eugene Davis — Crew Supervisor — Street Department — 35 years of service
2. Greg Smith — Fire Captain — Fire Department — 20 years of service
3. Michael Elwood — Police Officer — Police Department — 5 years of service
4. Leona Anson — Telecommunications Officer — Police Department — 5 years of service
5. Sherria McDonald — Accounting Tech — Finance Department — 5 years of service
6. Brandon Stetzenbach — Lead Mechanic — Vehicle Maintenance Department — 5 years of service
7. Gary Laboube — Mechanic — Vehicle Maintenance Department — 5 years of service
I. MINUTES

1. Pre-Council Meeting October 19, 2015
2. Regular Council Meeting October 19, 2015

II. REPORT OF SPECIAL BOARDS, COMMISSIONS AND COMMITTEES

III. ROLL CALL OF STANDING COMMITTEES
A. PUBLIC SAFETY — Councilmember Russell Driskell

B. PUBLIC WORKS - Councilmember Tolbert Rowe

1. Award proposal for an Airport Consultant for a term of 5 years for the Sedalia Regional Airport

2. Award bid for Rock

3. Approve sole source purchase of a flight motor and gearbox for the mixer at the Southeast Wastewater
Treatment Plant from JCI Industries in the amount of $21,489

4. Award bids for the demolition of structures located at 1520 South Vermont, 528 North Washington, 705
West 11" and 416 East 2™

5. Award bid for the Mill and Overlay of South Madison Avenue from Highway 50 to 16" Street

C. FINANCE / ADMINISTRATION — Councilmember James Cunningham
1. Approve Records Destruction Request from the Personnel Department

V. NEW BUSINESS
A. ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS

O Amending the budget for the Fiscal Year 2015-2016 (Staffing at the Animal Shelter)

O Accepting a quit claim deed for sections of Main Street and Oak Grove Lane and accepting said streets for
city maintenance to the City of Sedalia, Missouri from the County of Pettis, Missouri

O Approving and accepting an agreement by and between the City of Sedalia, MISSOUI‘I and APAC-Missouri,
Inc. for the Mill and Overlay of South Madison Avenue from Highway 50 to 16" Street in the City of
Sedalia, Missouri

O Calling a general election to be held on April 5, 2016 for the purpose of electing a Municipal Judge and one
Councilman from each of the four wards in the City of Sedalia, Missouri

O Amending Chapter 10, Article IV of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia relating to Building
Codes (1* Reading; 2“0l Reading to occur 90 days after)

O Amending Chapter 10, Article VII Electrical Code of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (1™
Reading; 2" Reading to occur 90 days after)

O Amending Chapter 10, Article V Existing Building Code of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia
(1* Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)

O Amending Chapter 24, Article II Fire Prevention Code of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (1
Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)


jmyers
Text Box
Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation 


Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation

O Amending Chapter 10, Article VI Mechanical Code of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (1
Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)

O Amending Chapter 10, Article VIII Plumbing and Gas Code of the Code of Ordinances of the City of
Sedalia (1™ Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)

O Amending Chapter 10, Article X, Division 2 International Property Maintenance Code of the Code of
Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (1 Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after)

B. APPOINTMENTS

New:
*Appoint — Rick Adams — Housing Authority Board of Directors — Completing Larry Billingsley’s Term
Expiring June 2016
*Appoint — Ann Richardson — Planning & Zoning Commission — Completing Chris Patton’s Term
Expiring June 2018
*Appoint — Kevin Wade — Planning & Zoning Commission — Completing La Vera Schmitt’s Term
Expiring June 2019

C. LIQUOR LICENSES
Renewals: :
*Sandra Gibson dba Cork N Bottle, 3806 E Broadway, Packaged Liquor with Sunday Sales, $450
*Jennifer Edwards dba End Zone Sports Bar & Grill, 3129 W Broadway, Liquor by the Drink with
Sunday Sales, $750
*Ronda Thomas dba County Distributing Co., Inc., 1800 Eagleview Dr., Wholesale Beer, $50
*Thomas Munson dba Best Western State Fair Inn, 3120 S Limit, Sunday Sales, $300

D. APPROVAL OF DEPARTMENT BILLS
E. MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS FROM MAYOR, CITY COUNCIL AND CITY ADMINISTRATOR
F. GOOD AND WELFARE

G. ADJOURN TO CLOSED DOOR SESSION — In accordance with Sections 610.021 (1) & (2) RSMo to
closed-door session for Legal Advice, Lease, Sale or Purchase of Real Estate.

IF YOU HAVE SPECIAL NEEDS, WHICH REQUIRE ACCOMMODATION, PLEASE NOTIFY THE CITY
CLERK’S OFFICE. ACCOMMODATIONS WILL BE MADE FOR YOUR NEEDS.


jmyers
Text Box
Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation 


OFFICE OF THE CITY ADMINISTRATOR

This meeting begins at 6:15 PM

Presentations:
1. Building Code Updates — Andrew Burt

Public Safety Committee:

1. Review Ordinance amending the budget for Fiscal Year 2015-2016 for the Sedalia Animal Shelter
staffing needs. Because of increased duties at the current animal shelter, it is necessary to change a
part-time position to a full-time position. If approved, there will be two full-time people at the shel-
ter. ,

Public Works Committee:

1. Review proposal and staff recommendation for an airport consultant for the Sedalia Regional Airport.
The City currently has an airport consultant, but it is time to review renewal options. Consequently, we
have requested the qualifications of interested consultants. A committee of staff members, including
the Airport Director reviewed the qualifications using a point system and recommend that the current
consultant, Lochner, be approved. Ten firms were asked for qualifications. Five were received, but
one of those did not meet requirements, so four were reviewed.

2. Review bids for rock. Stockman Quarry is the low bidder; however, they are located in Jefferson City,
so the fuel cost and time to pick up the rock makes their total cost too high. Consequently, as in years
past, staff is recommending that the City award the bid to a closer company, Boone Quarries, as they
are local and the fuel and time savings will cover the difference in the price of rock.

3. Review Ordinance accepting a quit claim deed for sections of Main Street and Oak Grove Lane and ac-
cepting said streets for city maintenance to the City from Pettis County. The acceptance of these sec-
tions of street has been discussed with Pettis County for a period of time. Because of anticipated and
current development in this area it is advisable for the City to be able to control traffic planning; conse-
quently having it in the city limits is recommended.

4. Review quote from JCI Industries for the sole source purchase of a flight motor and gearbox for the
mixer at the Southeast Wastewater Treatment Plant in the amount of $21,489. This is slightly above
the budgeted amount of $20,000. The slight overage can be covered by budgeted funds.

5. Review bids for the demolition of structures located at 1520 South Vermont, 528 N. Washington, 705
W. 11" and 416 E. 2™, In all cases the low bid is being recommended.

6. Review bids and ordinance approving and accepting an agreement between the City and APAC-
Missouri, Inc. for the mill and overlay of South Madison Ave from Highway 50 to 16" Street in the
City. This work is necessary because of Site Rite Construction Company sewer work in the area.
$96, 407 of this cost will be deducted from the Site Rite Company’s contract leaving $19,993 to be
covered by the $30 million funds. Three bids were received for this mill and overlay work ranging from
$116,400 to $146,900. Staff recommends that the low bid from APAC be accepted.

7. Review ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article IV of the Code of Ordinances of the City relating to
building codes (1* reading; 2nd reading to occur 90 days after). This and the following six items per-
tain to Andrew Burt’s presentation.

8. Review ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VII electrical code of the City code of ordinances (r
reading; 2™ reading to occur 90 days after).

Page one of two

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




9. Review ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article V, Existing Building Code of the City Code of Ordi-
nances (1% Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after).

10. Review ordinance amending Chapter 24, Article II Fire Prevention Code of the City Code of Ordinanc-
es (1 Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after).

11. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VI Mechanical Code of the City Code of Ordinances
(1% Reading; 2™ reading 90 days after).

12. Review ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VIII Plumbing and Gas Code of the City Code of Or-
dinances (1¥ Reading; 2™ Reading to occur 90 days after).

13. Review ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article X, Division 2 International Property Maintenance
Code of the City Code (1* reading; 2™ reading to occur 90 days after).

Finance/Administration Committee:
1. Review ordinance calling for a General Election to be held on April 5, 2016 for the purpose of elect-
ing a municipal judge and one Councilman from each of the four wards in the City of Sedalia.
2. Review records destruction request from the Personnel Department.

Page two of two

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI
PRE-COUNCIL MEETING - OCTOBER 19, 2015

WORK SESSION '
The Work Session started at 6:15 p.m. in the Mayor’s Conference Room at the Municipal Building.

Council Members present were James Cunningham, Jo Lynn Turley, Russell Driskell, Bonita Nash,
Donald Meier, Bob Cross, Tolbert Rowe and Vicky Collins.

Presentation — Public Works Board Update
Jack Robinson, with Public Works Board, presented general information on the operation of the
Sedalia Water Department.

The billing for the Water Department has been streamlined with the use of 11,000 new self-reporting
meters. After 4 years of service, the accuracy of the meters is between 95 to 100% with 99.9% of the
meters reporting a majority of the time. The Water Department is currently in the process of drilling
an additional well located on the East side of South Park to allow for the permanent separation from
Spring Fork Lake as a water supply for more dependable higher quality water. GIS mapping of the
water system is at 50% completion and is being worked on daily and may be completed next year.

Presentation — Financial Update

Finance Director, Kelvin Shaw, presented a financial update regardlng sales tax and expenditures.

Sales tax for FY 2016 in the month of October is down 6.3% and year to date is up 2.7% with total
from all taxes collected (Franchise & Cigarette Tax, Transportation Tax, Property Tax Collection) year
to date showing an increase of 2.6%.

Fiscal Year-to-Date Expenditures:
® General Government Administration and Support shows an increase of 5.1%
e Public Safety has increased 4.0%
Transportation has increased 5.5%
Library has increased 0.9%
Parks and Recreation shows an increase of 11.5%
Projects and Capital Improvements shows a decrease of 38.2% with spend down fund balance
(Use Tax to begin soon).
e  Year to date 41.8% of the budget has been spent.

COMMITTEE MEETING
Public Safety Committee — Councilman Driskell, Chairman, presented the following
recommendation:
¢ Ordinance amending Ordinance No. 9940 relating to amending an existing classification and
job description for Animal Care Attendant for the Sedalia Police Department (convert current
part—tlme position to a full t1me posmon at Amma] Shelter) was moved to full Council on

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




Public Works Committee ~ Councilman Rowe, Chairman, presented the following recommendation:

Ordinance granting a rezoning application by Nathan Ahern and Rhonda Ahern, Husband and
Wife, for property located at 1227 West Main, 1301 West Main and 1307 West Main in the
City of Sedalia, Missouri (Real Estate Business) was moved to full Council on motion by
Turley, seconded by Driskell. All in favor.

Finance/Administration Committee — Councilman Cunningham, Chairman, presented the following

recommendations:

Ordinance amending Section 18-37 of the Sedalia City Code and repealing Ordinance #8635
relating to the division of the City into wards and precincts (it was found that census figures
from federal government were inaccurate; correct figures obtained; Ward Adjustment
Committee presented recommendations for adjustments to keep population sizes similar within
wards and precincts)(City Administrator, Gary Edwards, commented that several options were
considered and option 3 was found to be the best solution by the committee) was moved to full
Council on motion by Rowe, seconded by Nash. All in favor.

Ordinance amending Section 16-2(e) of Chapter 16 of the City’s Code of Ordinances by
increasing the fees collected by the Sedalia Municipal Court for the purpose of providing
operating expenses for shelters for battered persons and incorporating said fees into the City’s
fee schedule (fee currently $2.00, raising to $4.00). City Attorney, Anne Gardner, stated that
the effective date of the proposed ordinance will be January 1, 2016. Item was moved to full
Council on motion by Driskell, seconded by Nash. All in favor.

With no further comments, the meeting closed at 6:33 p-m.
Respectfully submitted: Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




CITY OF SEDALJA, MISSOURI
COUNCIL MEETING — OCTOBER 19, 2015

The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri duly met on Monday, October 19, 2015, at 7:00
p.m. at the Municipal Building with Mayor Stephen J. Galliher presiding. Mayor Galliher called
the meeting to order and asked for a moment of silent prayer followed by the Pledge of
Allegiance led by Councilman Nash.

ROLL CALL:

James Cunningham Present Donald Meier Present
Jo Lynn Turley Present Bob Cross Present
Russell Driskell Present Tolbert Rowe Present
Bonita Nash Present Vicky Collins Present

Mayor Galliher welcomed former Mayor Larry Foster who was in attendance at the meeting.

SERVICE AWARDS: None.

MINUTES: - ,
The following minutes were approved on motion by Cunningham, seconded by Turley. All in
favor. |

e Pre-Council Meeting October 5, 2015

e Regular Council Meeting October 5, 2015

REPORTS OF SPECIAL BOARDS., COMMISSIONS & COMMITTEES:

The following minutes were approved on motion by Driskell, seconded by Meier. All in favor.
e Citizen’s Traffic Advisory Commission dated September 16, 2015
e Planning & Zoning Commission dated September 2, 2015

ROLL CALL OF STANDING COMMITTEES:

PUBLIC SAFETY — RUSSELL DRISKELL, CHAIRMAN — No Report.

PUBLIC WORKS — TOLBERT ROWE, CHAIRMAN - No Report.

FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION — JAMES CUNNINGHAM, CHAIRMAN — No Report.

NEW BUSINESS:

BILL NO. 2015 — 126, ORDINANCE NO. 10377 — AN ORDINANCE AMENDING
ORDINANCE NO. 9940 RELATING TO AMENDING AN EXISTING CLASSIFICATION
AND JOB DESCRIPTION FOR ANIMAL CARE ATTENDANT FOR THE SEDALIA
POLICE DEPARTMENT was read once by title.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




2" Reading — Motion by Meier, seconded by Nash. All in favor.

Final Passage — Motion by Driskell, seconded by Nash. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting “Yes” were Cunningham, Turley, Driskell, Nash, Meier, Cross, Rowe
and Collins. No one voted “No”.

BILL NO. 2015 — 127, ORDINANCE NO. 10378 — AN ORDINANCE GRANTING A

REZONING APPLICATION' BY NATHAN AHERN AND RHONDA AHERN, HUSBAND

AND WIFE, FOR PROPERTY LOCATED AT 1227 WEST MAIN, 1301 WEST MAIN AND

1307 WEST MAIN IN THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI was read once by title.

2" Reading — Motion by Cunningham, seconded by Turley. All in favor.

Final Passage — Motion by Turley, seconded by Meier. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting “Yes” were Cunningham, Turley, Driskell, Nash, Meier, Cross, Rowe
and Collins. No one voted “No”.

BILL NO. 2015 — 128, ORDINANCE NO. 10379 — AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION

18-37 OF THE SEDALIA CITY CODE AND REPEALING ORDINANCE #8635 RELATING

TO THE DIVISION OF THE CITY INTO WARDS AND PRECINCTS, IN THE CITY OF

SEDALIA, MISSOURI was read once by title.

2" Reading — Motion by Rowe, seconded by Cunningham. All in favor.

Final Passage — Motion by Driskell, seconded by Turley. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting “Yes” were Cunningham, Turley, Driskell, Nash, Meier, Cross, Rowe
and Collins. No one voted “No”.

City Attorney, Anne Gardner, reminded Council that the effective date for the following
ordinance will be January 1, 2016 and not October 20, 2015.

BILL NO. 2015 — 129, ORDINANCE NO. 10380 — AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION

16-2(e) OF CHAPTER 16 OF THE CITY’S CODE OF ORDINANCES BY INCREASING

THE FEES COLLECTED BY THE SEDALIA MUNICIPAL COURT FOR THE PURPOSE OF

PROVIDING OPERATING EXPENSES FOR SHELTERS FOR BATTERED PERSONS AND

INCORPORATING SAID FEES INTO THE CITY’S FEE SCHEDULE was read once by title.

2™ Reading — Motion by Meier, seconded by Nash. All in favor.

Final Passage — Motion by Rowe, seconded by Driskell. All in favor.

Roll Call Vote: Voting “Yes” were Cunningham, Turley, Driskell, Nash, Meier, Cross, Rowe
and Collins. No one voted “No”.

APPOINTMENTS:
The following Board Appointment by Mayor Galliher was read and approved on motion by
Cunningham, seconded by Meier. All in favor.

BOTHWELL REGIONAL HEALTH CENTER BOARD OF TRUSTEES:
Appoint Joyce Foster, 306 W. Johnson, completing Mary Nell Strautman’s term expiring June
2017.

BIDS: None.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




LIQUOR LICENSES: None.

DEPARTMENT BILLS thru October 19, 2015 totaling $498,917.60 were approved for payment
on motion by Turley, seconded by Driskell. All in favor.

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS FROM MAYOR/COUNCIL/ADMINISTRATOR: None.

GOOD & WELFARE:

Gary Blake voiced concern regarding sewer fees. Mr. Blake stated that when he moved to his
current location outside City limits, fees were $23.88 and now they are $67.00 and added that he
1s not on city water, just sewer. Mr. Blake asked that the City look into the rates. City
Administrator, Gary Edwards, stated that if a person lives outside City limits the fees are higher,
however the issue will be looked into.

Kim Welch, 1500 S. Barrett, voiced concern regarding a vacant house at 1501 W. 16™. Ms.
Welch stated that items were taken out of the house and placed at the curb and people have been
going through the items and scattering them everywhere making a mess and creating a health
hazard. Mayor Galliher stated that he would check on the situation.

The meeting adjourned at 7:12 p.m. to a Closed-Door Session in accordance with Sections
610.021 (1) & (2) RSMo for Legal Advice and Lease, Sale or Purchase of Real Estate on motion
by Turley, seconded by Meier. All in favor.

/SEALIA, MISSOURI

€phen J. Galliher, Mayor

//' '
(/////ﬁ//ﬂ/t_,(’\ M/L&u/ M/OC -
Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




SEDALIA REGIONAL AIRPORT
MEMO

To: Gary Edwards
From: John Evang.cﬁz
Subject: Airport Consultant

Date: October 29, 2015

Gary,

Per the FAA and MoDOT Aviation Section, we are required to select an airport
consultant every five years. We ask 10 firms for their proposals. We received five
proposals; one did not follow the requirements. Our selection committee was comprised
of Gary Edwards, John Simmons, Devin Lake and me. The review committee selected
Lochner, our current consultant.

We are asking that the council members vote on our selection. The agreement will start
after council approval on Monday, November 2, 2015.

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




To: Gary Edwards

From: Ellen Cross
Date: October 28, 2015
Subject: Rock Bid

We have solicited bids for rock and we received four bids.

Stockman Quarry is the low bidder however their quarry is in Jefferson City. The fuel
cost and time to pick up the rock would not be feasible.

It is my recommendation that we award the bid to Boone Quarries as they are local and
the fuel and time savings will cover the difference in the price of the rock.

Thank you,

Dhor bora_

Pre-CouncilAgenda : CouncilAgenda




Tabulation of Bids

Rock

October 13,2015 10:15 a.m.
Mayor's Conference Room

Stockman Quarry

Boone Quarries-Sedalia

APAC - Missouri, Inc.

Higgins Materials, LLC

tons

1" Road Rock- 3,000
Tons

Aggregate Base
Material Type 1
Agpgregate —

3,000 Tons

Crush Run-100%
passing

1 % Sieve — 1,400
tons

3” Size Screen Rock -

100 tons

2 Size Screen Rock -
200 tons

1” Size Pug Rock -

1,400 tons

8.00/ton

5.35/ton

6.80/ton

7.75on

7.75/ton

6.75/ton

8.00/ton

7.50/ton

7.50/ton

9.25/ton — 3" Clean

7.50/ton- 3” Base

9.25/ton—2” Clean
7.50/ton- 2” Base

7.95/ton

8.20/ton

7.95/ton

7.95/ton

9.80/ton

9.80/ton

7.95/ton (1" Base)

3918 Stockman Lane 21427 Dunham Dr. 1591 E. Prathersville Rd. 2347 BB Hwy
Jefferson City, MO 65109 Sedalia, MO 65301 Columbia, MO 65202 Otterville, MO 65348
Matt Mertens Greg Alderson Bryan Dunn Keith Higgins
(573) 893-6688 829-5555 (417) 207-7815 (660) 252-4540
Bid Item
1" Clean Rock - 1,500 8.75/on 9.90/ton 10.15/ton 8.85/ton

8.45/ton

7.95/ton

N/A

N/A

8.00/ton
2" Clean Rock

7.40/ton
1" Base Rock

Mid-Missouri Limestone - . P.0. Box 52, Old Highway 40 East, Kingdom City, MO 65262 - Bid was received after bid opening

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




To:
From:
Date:
Subject:

Gary Edwards

Ellen Cross

October 27, 2015

Sole Source Purchase of Flight Motor and Gearbox

The Water Pollution Control Department needs to make some repairs to the mixer at the
southeast wastewater treatment plant. The repairs include replacing the Flight motor and
gearbox which are key pieces of equipment for the mixer to function properly. These are
sole source purchases as this is the only supplier for Flight parts which must fit the
existing equipment and it is old.

I am requesting we accept the quote from JCI Industries for $21,489.00. We have
budgeted $20,000.00 for this repair.

Thank you.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




Bid Sheet for items $501 to $4,099'

item Bid: 4410 Mixer

Item Description: Fjyqt motor and gearbox

: Vendor Name

JCI Industries

! Vendor Address

1161 Hamblen Road
Lee's Summit, Mo 64081

Vendor Phone

816-525-3320

Amount of Quote

$21,489

| Vendor Name

Vendor Address

Vendor Phone

Amount of Quote

Vendor Name

Vendor Address

Vendor Phone

Amount of Quote

Vendor Selected

JCI

Amount

$21,489

Sole source for our area.

Reason
Not possible to install different brand in this situation.
This is one piece of four to complete a rack of mixers.
.
Approved

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




Xylem Water Solutions

Peter MacPherson
Territory Manager

14612 366" Street
Menahga, MN -
Tel 218-564-5840 Cell 320-292-1310

1-10-2015

Mr. Andrew Voth

JCI Industries

1161 SE Hamblen Road
Lee:s Summit, MO 64081

D“eér Andrew:

| am writing in regards to customer questions regarding your coverage area for Flygt. This letter
is confirmation that JC! Industries is our sole authorized municipal sales and a service.

distributor in Kansas and Western:MO.

| hope this clears up any questions your customer base has reg
- Flygt products. ‘

Please contact me with any questions you may have.
~ Sincerely,

Peter MacPherson
~ Territory Manager

Flygt Products

A Xylem Brand

arding your representation of

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




JCl Industries, Inc.

1161 SE Hamblen Rd.
Lee's Summit, MO 64081
Tel: 816-525-3320

__ www.jciind.com

Tuesday, October 20, 2015
Sedalia, City of
901 East 3rd Street
Sedalia, MO 65301

Phone: 660-826-3857
Fax:

Attention: Doug Knight
Subject: New Flygt 4410 Mixer
Quotation #: 0562536056AVL-001
Please refer to this number when ordering
Doug Knight:

We are pleased to respond to your request for quotation with the following items. Please reference
our quotation number on all related correspondence.

Attached is our proposal for the Flygt 4410 you requested.

Shipment is 10-12 Weeks After Receipt of Order + Transit.

Best regards,

Andrew Voth Mitchell Hoffman
Applications Engineer Sales Engineer
- JCl Industries, Inc. JCl Industries, Inc.

816-401-8705

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




Quote #: 0562536056AVL-001

JCl Industries, Inc.

1161 SE Hamblen Rd.
Lee's Summit, MO 64081
Tel: 816-525-3320

| wwwiciindcom

Tuesday, October 20, 2015

1.00

2.00

Flygt Model 4410.011 Mixer 1 $21,089.00 $21,089.00
3.5hp, 460V, 3 Phase

Duplicate of s/n: 4410.011-8475003

*Need to verify propeller diameter & speed prior to
ordering

Freight Estimate 1 $400.00 $400.00

Subtotal $21,489.00

Total $21,489.00

Lead Time 10-12 Weeks After Payment Terms Net 30

Receiving Order

Shipping Method Best Way Shipping Terms Prepaid and Added to Invoice

F.0.B. Warehouse This Quotation is valid for 60 days.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




JCl Industries, Inc.

1161 SE Hamblen Rd.
Lee's Summit, MO 64081
Tel: 816-525-3320

STANDARD TERMS OF SALE

1. Applicable Terms. These terms govern the purchase and sale of the equipment and related services, if any (collectively, "Equipment"), referred
to in Seller's purchase order, quotation, proposal or acknowledgment, as the case may be ("Seller's Documentation”). Whether these terms are
included in an offer or an acceptance by Seller, such offer or acceptance is conditioned on Buyer's assent to these terms. Seller rejects all additional
or different terms in any of Buyer's forms or documents.

2. Payment, Buyer shall pay Seller the full purchase price as set forth in Seller's Documentation. Unless Seller's Documentation provides
otherwise, freight, storage, insurance and all taxes, duties or other governmental charges relating to the Equipment shall be paid by Buyer. If Seller is
required to pay any such charges, Buyer shall immediately reimburse Seller. All payments are due within 30 days after receipt of invoice. Buyer shall
be charged the lower of 1 %% interest per month or the maximum legal rate on all amounts not received by the due date and shall pay all of Seller's
reasonable costs (including attorneys’ fees) of collecting amounts due but unpaid.

3. Delivery, Delivery of the Equipment shall be in material compliance with the schedule in Seller's Documentation.

4. Ownership of Materials. All devices, designs (including drawings, plans and specifications), estimates, prices, notes, electronic data and other
documents or information prepared or disclosed by Seller, and all related intellectual property rights, shall remain Seller's property. Seller grants
Buyer a non-exclusive, non-transferable license to use any such material solely for Buyer's use of the Equipment. Buyer shall nat disclose any such
material to third parties without Seller's prior written consent.

5. Changes. Seller shall not implement any changes in the scope of work described in Selfer's Documentation uness Buyer and Seller agree in
writing to the details of the change and any resulting price, schedule or other contractual modifications. This includes any changes necessitated by a
change in applicable law occurring after the effective date of any contract including these terms.

6. Warranty, Subject to the following sentence, Seller warrants to Buyer that the Equipment shall materially conform to the description in Seller's
Documentation and shall be free from defects in material and workmanship. The foregoing warranty shall not apply to any Equipment that is
specified or otherwise demanded by Buyer and is not manufactured or selected by Seller, as to which (i) Seller hereby assigns to Buyer, to the extent
assignable, any warranties made to Seller and (ii) Seller shall have no other liability to Buyer under warranty, tort or any other legal theory. If Buyer
gives Seller prompt written notice of breach of this warranty within 18 months from defivery or 1 year from acceptance, whichever occurs first (the
""Warranty Period"), Seller shall, at its sole option and as Buyer's sole remedy, repair or replace the subject parts or refund the purchase price
therefor. If Seller determines that any claimed breach is not, in fact, covered by this warranty, Buyer shall pay Seller its then customary charges for
any repair or replacement made by Seller. Seller's warranty is conditioned on Buyer's (a) operating and maintaining the Equipment in accardance
with Seller's instructions, (b) not making any unauthorized repairs or alterations, and (c) not being in default of any payment obligation to Seller.
Seller's warranty does not cover damage caused by chemical action or abrasive material, misuse or improper installation {unless insialled by Seller).
THE WARRANTIES SET FORTH IN THIS SECTION ARE SELLER'S SOLE AND EXCLUSIVE WARRANTIES AND ARE SUBJECT TO SECTION 10 BELOW. SELLER
MAKES NO OTHER WARRANTIES OF-ANY KIND, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, INCLUDING-WITHOUT LIMITATION, ANY WARRANTY OF MERCHANTABILITY OR
FITNESS FOR PURPOSE.

7. Indemnity. Seller shall indemnify, defend and hold Buyer harmless from any claim, cause of action or liability incurred by Buyer as a result of
third party claims for personal injury, death or damage to tangible property, to the extent caused by Seller's negligence. Seller shall have the sole
authority to direct the defense of and settle any indemnified claim. Seller's indemnification is conditioned on Buyer (a) promptly, within the Warranty
Period, notifying Seller of any claim, and (b) providing reasonable cooperation in the defense of any claim.

8. Force Majeure, Neither Seller nor Buyer shall have any liability for any breach (except for breach of payment obligations) caused by extreme
weather or other act of God, strike or other labor shortage or disturbance, fire, accident, war or civil disturbance, delay of carriers, failure of normal
sources of supply, act of government or any other cause beyond such party's reasonable control.

9. Cancellation. If Buyer cancels or suspends its order for any reason other than Seller's breach, Buyer shall promptly pay Seller for work
performed prior to cancellation or suspension and any other direct costs incurred by Seller as a result of such cancellation or suspension.

10, LIMITATION OF LIABILITY, NOTWITHSTANDING ANYTHING ELSE TO THE CONTRARY, SELLER SHALL NOT BE LIABLE FOR ANY CONSEQUENTIAL,
INCIDENTAL, SPECIAL, PUNITIVE OR OTHER IND!RECT DAMAGES, AND SELLER'S TOTAL LIABILITY ARISING AT ANY TIME FROM THE SALE OR USE OF
THE EQUIPMENT SHALL NOT EXCEED THE PURCHASE PRICE PAID FOR THE EQUIPMENT. THESE LIMITATIONS APPLY WHETHER THE LIABILITY IS
BASED ON CONTRACT, TORT, STRICT LIABILITY OR ANY OTHER THEORY.

1. Miscellaneous, If these terms are issued in cornection with a government contract, they shall be deemed to include those federal acquisition
regulations that are required by law to be included. These terms, together with any quotation, purchase order or acknowledgement issued or signed
by the Selter, comprise the complete and exclusive statement of the agreement between the parties (the "Agreement”) and supersede any terms
contained in Buyer's documents, unless separately signed by Seller. No part of the Agreement may be changed or cancelled except by a written
document signed by Seller and Buyer. Na course of dealing or performance, usage of trade or failure to enforce any term shall be used to modify the
Agreement. if any of these terms is unenforceable, such term shall be limited only to the extent necessary to make it enforceable, and all other terms
shall remain in fult force and effect. Buyer may not assign or permit any other transfer of the Agreement without Selier's prior written consent. The
Agreement shall be governed by the laws of the State of Delaware without regard to its conflict of laws provisions.
12, Credit Approval: If at any time information available on Purchaser’s financial condition or credit history, in JCI's judgment, does not justify the
terms of payment specified herein, JCI may require full or partial payment in advance, or an acceptable for of payment guarantee such as a bank
letter of credit, or other modifications to terms of payment.

Backcharges: JCI shall not be liable for any charges incurred by Purchaser for work, repairs, replacements or alterations to the Products, without JCI's
prior written authorization, and any adverse consequences resulting from such unauthorized work shall be Purchaser's full responsibility.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




“Citty off Sodttsttn

MUNICIPAL BUILDING
200 SOUTH OSAGE AVENUE
SEDALIA, MISSOURI 65301

TELEPHONE (860) 827-3000

MEMO
To: Gary Edwards, City Administrator
From: Andrew S. Burt, Chief Building Official M
Date: October 27, 2015
Subject: Bids For Demolition

FAX (660) 827-7800

In accordance with the City of Sedalia purchasing policy, we have obtained quotes for demolition

of the structures located at the following properties:

1520 South Vermont

Schultz Wrecking $3,800.00
Poort Excavating LLC $3,500.00
B & P Excavating $3,650.00

Recommend awarding bid to Poort Excavating in the amount of $3,500.00

528 North Washington

Schultz Wrecking $3,000.00
Poort Excavating LLC $3,200.00
B & P Excavating $3,675.00

Recommend awarding bid to Schultz Wrecking in the amount of $3,000.00

705 West 11"

Schultz Wrecking $3,000.00
Poort Excavating LLC $2,750.00
B & P Excavating $3,500.00

Recommend awarding bid to Poort Excavating LLC in the amount of $2,750.00

416 East 2™

Schultz Wrecking $5,000.00
Poort Excavating LL.C $4,800.00
B & P Excavating No Bid

Recommend awarding bid to Poort Excavating LLC in the amount of $4,800.00

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




To: Gary Edwards

From: Ellen Cross

Date: October 28, 2015

Subject: Mill and Overly of Various Streets

We have solicited bids for the mill and overlay of Madison Avenue from
Highway 50 to 16™ Street. We received three bids ranging from $116,400.00
to $146,900.00. I recommend we accept the low bid from APAC-Missouri,
Inc., Columbia, MO. We have used this company in the past with no issues.

The mill and overlay of Madison Avenue is necessary due to the extensive
sewer work in the area. Madison Avenue from Broadway to 12" Street was
excavated to replace the sewer main under the street. Part of the contract
with Site Right Construction Company was to replace only the portion of
Madison that was excavated. Due to construction traffic on Madison
Avenue the whole street, from Broadway to 16™ Street, needs to be repaired.

$96,407.00 will be deducted out of Site Rite Construction Company’s

contract leaving $19,993.00 additional funds to be covered out of the $30
million.

Thank %V/LL/
f YL

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




ounciIAgenda

2
4

~5aA

S3A

R

S3A

S3A

ERREET S

TGl

puog p!

S3A

. uolsnjjo)-uy|

SIA[

00006ty S

00'808'8€

~ | 0000t'vE" §

117V 40| 430.24&4...9. :

00°066'9YT $

00'Stt'ovT

-1 00'00¥9TT &

INNOWY-1VLOL}.

00'00S'T€ $ | 00°SOT -

00'€v9'67

00E:-

S Neyy

77 ynm soejday |

' 00'G9T'6

86§ 00056'5C 50598~ 3.

“"looet

S T

"aseq oy ,p-anoway|:

00°00v'0T $|008 S

J-o0'0s¥'8" s {059 - S

E _Eﬁ oL om >_>>:.. INOSIQYIN|-

T T# 3LYNYALY]

00°00T'9¢- $ | 0275~ $

.8 mom@

-00°00L'8T - §| O LE S

ST T

T SYIVd3Y 3M1IV4 35Y79.03LVID0SSY|

00:08%'20T $°| 8¥'T0T. S

} oc,.own..mw...

yLi98 5

0000598 $.[ 0598 § |

Ael1enQ T

tn-93p3 9%, 2

00'0T¥'8T $[92's §

00°005°'LT

00's S

00002t $|0ZE ¢

unowy 350D Hun

Tunowy. . | 3503 Wun

‘. pmou. Hun

E:oE<a,,

£10v9 OW ‘sBundsanigl- -
~ | -peodsw3BiHog0sE

LIVT X08.0d *

©. 18059; O /u0oldL .-

_3_ m___aafe Hmma

. i b_ucmsd

uonduasaq)

.u:_ .::omm__>_-u<n_<

-] palewnsy-

*Ju|-*0) duired wapuey

*3u] 09 Suired Yeydsy suidSiH|

wooy ..m”ucwkmquu,. mmo>m_>__..,
_— ST ‘wd 00:7 §T02/£Z439010 "+
SR Lo 0T s)1934)8 snoliep ) A A0 IIN

Pre-CouncilAgenda




PERSONNEL DEPARTMENT

November 2, 2015

Mayor Steve Galliher
Members of the City Council
Sedalia, Missouri

RE: Original Records Destruction

As per RSMo 109.250(4), City records that are on file in the Personnel Office and have met the retention schedule
will be destroyed in compliance with the guidelines established by the Secretary of State’s Office. The Personnel
Office does hereby request that the City Council authorize the destruction of the following documents:

- Unsuccessful Airport Attendant Applications — November, 2014 — Retention 1 year;

- Unsuccessful PW Service Worker Applications — November, 2014 — Retention 1 year;

- Unsuccessful Police Officer Applications (Indeed.com) — October, 2014 — Retention 1 year;

- Unsuccessful Fire Fighter Applications (testing cancelled) — October, 2014 — Retention 1 year;
- Unsuccessful Building Service Worker Applications — November, 2014 — Retention 1 year;

- General Application (unsolicited) — May, 2015 — Retention 6 months.

I hereby certify that the records described are no longer needed in the transaction of current business and no
longer possess sufficient administrative, legal, historical or fiscal value to warrant further keeping.
Method of destruction will be by shredder.

Sincerely,

John L. Rice
Personnel Director

City of Sedalia * 200 South Osage Avenue * Sedalia, MO 65301
Phone 660-827-3000 Fax 660-827-7818

| Ere-Eounuﬁgenaa | ouncitAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE BUDGET FOR THE FISCAL YEAR 2015-2016.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI as follows:

Section 1. The 2015-2016 fiscal year budget beginning April 1, 2015 and ending March
31, 2016 is hereby amended by increasing certain expenditures as they appear on the attached
schedule and made a part hereof as Exhibit A as if fully set out herein.

Section 2. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

Read two times by title, copies of the proposed ordinance having been made available for
public inspection prior to the time the bill is under consideration by the Council and passed by
the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri this 2" day of November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 2™ day of November 2015.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor

ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




L Jo | abeq

CounciIAgenda

aouejeq pun4 pajoslold uj (esea1oa(]) asealou] 1aN (0o ¥pe'0lL) salnjipuadxy ssa SANUAAIY JON
G2'820'L. 09'¥¥e'0l 59'€89'09 spund jo sas / sainypuadx3 |ejo
awl] |In4 o1 uonissod ewl] Ued abueyd ¢/'¢z/ 9199 LG9°159 insuj uonesadwo) sJaNIOM  00-801-12-01
8l |In4 OL UoliSsSOd awi] Hed ebueyd zg'gsy's 81'908'C ¥9'259'9 goueinsuj @akoldws  00-L0L-12-0L
awl] |in4 o) uonissod awi] Hed sbueyd ¢1'606'c veoce 6.'88L'¢ sexe] aleoipa|y AliN08S (1008  00-901-L2-0)
auwll] |in4 0L uonissod awi) Hed sbueyd y61zp'9 90°06¥'L 88°L/6'y juswauney siebet 00-G0L-12-0L
ueyg o Aousby ybBnoiyl juelsissy swil| Hed €9'e¥0'G LSPLGL zl'625'e fousby |dw3 - susg % saleleS Gp-L0L-12-0l
|wi| |iInd oL uonissod swi| Ued ebueyny - (gz0LL'9) GZ0LL'9 awl} yed - ssieles 0t-L0L-12-01
awl] [in4 o] uonissod awil Hed ebueyd 00'L.8'Gh 09°26¢'01 0v'€lLg'Ge saleles 00-L0L-12-0)

spun4 jo sasn / sainjipuadx3y

SUENTI) 1ebpng abueyn 19bpng uoiduasag / Unoooy

pspualuy uaung _

Buiers sey8ys [ewiuy - §1L02/2/1 L Juswpuswy 186png gl A4
ellepag jo Ao

v Haiyxg

Pre-CouncilAgenda




201 WEST SECOND STREET
SEDALIA, MISSOURI 65301-3824
PHONE 660-827-7823
FAX 660-826-7040

CSM-3932 October 26, 2015

City Administrator Gary Edwards
City Council Members

Sir and Council Members,

As discussed, we are moving from a part time employee to a full time at the animal
shelter. Since July, we have had Miss Martin as the shelter manger, with a part-time
person from a temp agency. Sedalia Animal control officers help when they are not
answering calls. A tremendous burden is being placed on the shelter manager, when
the part time person is not there and the animal control officers are busy. She has to
clean, show people the animals for adoption, answer the phone, and do administration
duties.

All those duties are time consuming and leaves no time to plan and do fund

raisers. Miss Martin has been very gracious with her time worked over and above her
regular hours and many times have not taken a day off in a month due to no one being
there to run the shelter. Since July, the shelter has not been full and taking animals
from the city and private citizens and adoptions are up.

| have made several visits to the shelter and it has been clean, smelled good, and ran in
a professional manner. [f this is to continue and carry over to the new shelter which will
be bigger, another full time position is needed.

Respgacjtfully,

o
7

/.
[ Chief John DeGonia

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING A QUIT CLAIM DEED FOR SECTIONS OF MAIN STREET
AND OAK GROVE LANE AND ACCEPTING SAID STREETS FOR CITY MAINTENANCE TO
THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI FROM THE COUNTY OF PETTIS, MISSOURL

WHEREAS, a majority of the Pettis County Commission has asked the City of Sedalia to accept
the certain sections of Main Street and Oak Grove Lane for city maintenance as the street improvements
are acceptable to the city; see attached letter from said County Commission and the proposed quit claim
deed attached hereto, collectively as Exhibit A.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, as follows:

Section 1. The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri hereby approves and accepts a quit claim
deed for sections of Main Street and Oak Grove Lane, which are existing streets located within Pettis
County, Missouri from the County of Pettis, Missouri, as proposed on the attached quit claim deed known
as Exhibit A.

Section 2. The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri also approves and accepts for City
maintenance said sections of Main Street and Oak Grove Lane as said street improvements are acceptable
to the City.

Section 3. The City Clerk is hereby directed to file in her office a duplicate or copy of the deed
after it has been executed by the parties or their duly authorized representatives and after said deed has
been recorded with the Pettis County Recorder of Deed’s office.

Section 4. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

Read two times by title, copies of the proposed ordinance having been made available for public
inspection prior to the time the bill is under consideration by the Council and passed by the Council of the
City of Sedalia, Missouri this 2nd day of November, 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this this 2nd day of November, 2015.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




- COUNTY OF PETTIS

415 SoUuTH OHIO AVENUE, SUITE 212, SEDALIA, MISSOURI 6530 1
WWW.PETTISCOMO.COM

Jim Marcum David D. Dick D. Brent Hampy
Western Commissioner Presiding Commissioner Eastern Commissioner
660-826-5000 ext. 407 660-826-5000 ext. 405 660-826-5000 ext. 406

September 29, 2015

Gary Edwards
City Administrator, City of Sedalia

RE: Adoption of sections of Main Street and Oak Grove Lane

The County Commission does offer the attached descriptions for sections of Main Street
and Oak Grove Lane for adoption by the City of Sedalia. These roads are in a rapidly
developing area of the City of Sedalia and we believe control of these roads would
benefit the City.

This section of Main Street has been rebuilt and resurfaced. The base was reclaimed
and a base stabilizer added with additional base rock to strengthen the road before a
hard surface double chip and seal was applied. The culvert tube was replaced during
reconstruction of Main Street.

Oak Grove Lane was rebuilt in recent years by reclaiming the base, adding base rock,
and topping with 6 inches of asphalt. This method was used prior to discovery of the
base stabilizer product.

Adoption of these sections of roads would also allow the permitting of entrances at the
discretion of the City of Sedalia.

Thank you for your consideration.

N N0 o

e

Jim Marcum David D. Dick ~ 7D, Brent H

Wesiern Commissioner Fresiding Commissioner Eastern Commissioner

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




Title of Document: QUIT CLAIM DEED

Execution Date of Document:

Grantor’s Name & Mailing Address: County of Pettis, Pettis County Courthouse — 2™
Floor, 415 South Ohio Avenue, Sedalia, Missouri (C/O Pettis County Commission)

Grantee’s Name & Mailing Address: City of Sedalia, a Missouri Municipal Corporation, 200
South Osage Avenue, Sedalia, Missouri 65301 (Attention: City Administrator)

Book/Page & Document Type Referred to in this Document: N/A

Legal Description of Property: see below.

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, WITNESSETH: THAT SAID
GRANTOR, in consideration of good and other valuable consideration to it provided by the said
Grantee consisting of the conveyance of sections of said roads to Grantor, the receipt of which is
hereby acknowledged, does by these presents, Remise, Release, and forever Quit-Claim, unto the
said Grantee, its assigns and successors, the following described sections of roads, lying, being
and situated in the County of Pettis and State of Missouri, subject to easements and
encumbrances of record:

MAIN STREET ROAD

BEGINNING AT THE SOUTH QUARTER CORNER OF SECTION 31, TOWNSHIP 46 NORTH, RANGE 21
WEST OF THE FIFTH PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, PETTIS COUNTY, MISSOURI; THENCE SOUTH 0°06'07"
WEST, 50.0 FEET TO A POINT ON THE SOUTH LINE OF MAIN STREET ROAD; THENCE NORTH
89°53'53" WEST ALONG THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID MAIN STREET ROAD PARALLEL WITH AND 50.0
FEET SOUTH OF THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID SECTION 31171048 FEET; THENCE SOUTH 0390028

WEST, 15.0 FEET; THENCE NORTH 84°22'11" WEST, 268.90 FEET TO U.S. HIGHWAY 50 RIGHT-OF-WAY

1

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




STATION 684+50; THENCE NORTH 20°43'44" WEST, 167.67 FEET TO HIGHWAY STATION 683+35 AND
HIGHWAY MAIN STREET RELOCATION STATION 19+50; THENCE SOUTH 71°40'15" EAST, ALONG
THE NORTH LINE OF SAID HIGHWAY MAIN STREET RELOCATION, 138.74 FEET TO HIGHWAY MAIN
STREET RELOCATION STATION 20+88.6 PC; THENCE CONTINUING ALONG SAID NORTH LINE, IN A
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION ALONG A CURVE TO THE LEFT HAVING A RADIUS OF 201.43 FEET
AND A CHORD BEARING AND DISTANCE OF SOUTH 78°27'38" EAST, 200.19 FEET TO HIGHWAY
MAIN STREET RELOCATION STATION 23+08.1 PT; THENCE SOUTH 00°31'20" WEST, 34.54 FEET TO A
POINT ON THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID SECTION 31; THENCE SOUTH 89°53'53" EAST, ALONG SAID
SOUTH LINE, 1710.12 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING. SUBJECT TO HIGHWAY RIGHT-OF-WAY IF
ANY. BEING A PART OF SECTION 31, TOWNSHIP 46 NORTH, RANGE 21 WEST AND A PART OF
SECTION 6, TOWNSHIP 45 NORTH, RANGE 21 WEST OF THE FIFTH PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, PETTIS
COUNTY, MISSOURL

EAST SIDE OF OAK GROVE LANE ROAD

BEGINNING AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF THE SOUTHWEST QUARTER OF SECTION 31 IN
TOWNSHIP 46 NORTH RANGE 21 WEST OF THE FIFTH PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, PETTIS

COUNTY, MISSOURI; THENCE EAST ALONG THE NORTH LINE OF SAID SOUTHWEST

QUARTER, 20.0 FEET; THENCE SOUTH 00°19'20" WEST, PARALLEL WITH AND 20.0 FEET

EAST OF THE WEST LINE OF SAID SECTION 31, 2420.32 FEET TO A POINT ON THE NORTH
RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF U.S. HIGHWAY 50; THENCE NORTH 89°40'28" WEST, ALONG SAID
RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE, 35.19 FEET; THENCE NORTH 00°19'32" EAST, 290.80 FEET; THENCE NORTH
88°08'48" EAST, 15.18 FEET TO A POINT ON THE WEST LINE OF SAID SECTION 31; THENCE NORTH
00°19'20" EAST, ALONG SAID WEST LINE, 2129.44 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING.

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the same, with all the rights, immunities, privileges and
appurtenances thereto belonging unto said Grantee, its assigns and successors forever; so that
neither the Grantor; nor any other person or persons for it or in its name or behalf, shall or will
hereafter claim or demand any right or title to the aforesaid premises, or any part thereof, but
they and every one of them shall, by these presents, be excluded and forever barred.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, The said Grantor has caused these presents to be signed by a
majority of the County Commission and attested by its County Clerk, and the seal of County of
Pettis, Missouri to be hereto attached, the day and year first above written.

County of Pettis, Missouri
By: By: By:

Jim Marcum David Dick D. Brent Hampy
Western Commissioner Presiding Commissioner Eastern Commissioner

ATTEST:

Nicholas LaStrada
Pettis County Clerk

(SLALjJ

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




STATE OF MISSOURI )
) ss.
COUNTY OF PETTIS )

On this day of , 2015, before me appeared Jim Marcum, David
Dick and D. Brent Hampy, to me personally known, who being by me duly sworn, did say that
they are the Commissioners for the County of Pettis, Missouri, and that the seal affixed to the
foregoing instrument is the seal of said County and that said instrument was signed and sealed in
behalf of said County by the authority of the majority of the Pettis County Commission, and said
commissioners acknowledged said instrument to be the free act and deed of said County.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my notarial seal at
my office in Sedalia, Missouri, the day and year last above written.

Notary Public within and for
said County and State.
My Commission Expires:

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




PETILLE
AP 2 Y WD .,
VS NS R VIO TS XA AAUTE LN
h .M?umﬂmksﬂﬁoﬁn« NiddnL w
h e, e
,,,,,,, o ) RPN ALK SIS
— ’
- ETY]
,./‘Iv
i3 .
I
/ e
i . s
7
! T -
) . T . ~
__ \. memmmmmE T
_q SRR IS -
3
i \
Iy
B L L -
e TR TR . Ve
_.“NM\.., ﬂ»u,m)
— o A,.u\.b.
!
ol
-
-
2 B P ]
/ 0 SGCSBAN o R
\ - » yd /a.
5 5. s [ .
% v~ -~ Y gres e = :
00§ o= s ravnmIRl e tss N \ . b 5
A L0800 8 R
’ e

B2b51 M

dasr v mns 78 2y
BE T 9 BUE Y
P o gy

/ 2oy iy iy , ) k
o JPdtgniin " . ~2% X
3,055,460 w.m Z.l./flr/rl. A
e g vy 2
% 3 i :rwé« k3
. b :

£ 139 L3055 HLEON JOVEAL TIVEN SIS NIV 30 ST HINGT SHE NG SRR YD) S50 0 DF LS LU0 HLrOS EDNIHL
HIOSTI 'WINOGD 1AL MIGILIN Wk 3k 3L 30 252, |5 JONYU HILON 99 JIHENADL 3 NILLOTR 40 HINHOD ¥RUEVIID HLLOS BHL ¥ DRRKIEN!

NOILdIH0S3A NOILYXINNY avOod 133418 NIVIN

CouncilAgenda

Pre-CouncilAgenda




z zg ;::‘:r.-
- L]
EAST SIDE OF OAK GROVE LANE
ROAD ANNEXATION DESCRIPTION
Byl InL s Comen e 2 ST Ziae ey S o g et e 0l
g
3
§
bl
;
i
1}3
" o
H 2
.
s
I H
il 1
ié —
| v
1
i
g fon
P
/
;
.f"' 3
i
/ k
e ~ i
L Py
.‘T\”w ;’é
fhs: L i ‘E

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND ACCEPTING AN AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN
THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI AND APAC-MISSOURI, INC. FOR THE MILL AND
OVERLAY OF SOUTH MADISON AVENUE FROM HIGHWAY 50 TO 16™ STREET IN THE
CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURL

WHEREAS, The City of Sedalia, Missouri, received a proposal from APAC-Missouri, Inc.; and

WHEREAS, under the proposal, the City of Sedalia, Missouri, shall give the sum and amount of
One Hundred Sixteen Thousand Four Hundred Dollars ($116,400.00) to APAC-Missouri, Inc. for the
mill and overlay of South Madison Avenue from Highway 50 to 16™ Street contained in Project No.
2015-06, dated October 13, 2015 as described in the proposed agreement attached as Exhibit A and
~ incorporated by reference as though the proposed agreement were set forth herein.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, as follows:

Section 1. The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, hereby approves and accepts the
agreement by and between the City of Sedalia, Missouri, and APAC-Missouri, Inc. in substantively the
same form and content as the agreement has been proposed.

Section 2. The City Administrator is authorized and directed to execute and the City Clerk is
hereby authorized and directed to attest and fix the seal of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, on the
documents in substantively the same form and content as they have been proposed.

Section 3. The City Clerk is hereby directed to file in her office a duplicate or copy of the
documents after they have been executed by the parties or their duly authorized representatives.

Section 4. This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force and effect from and after its
passage and approval.

Read two times by title, copies of the proposed ordinance having been made available for public
inspection prior to the time the bill is under consideration by the Council and passed by the Council of
the City of Sedalia, Missouri this 2™ day of November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 2™ day of November 2015.

ATTEST: Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor

Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda



CITY OF

SEDALIA, MISSOURI

NOTICE TO CONTRACTORS
PROPOSAL, CONTRACT, BOND, AND SPECIFICATIONS
FOR

MILL AND OVERLAY OF VARIOUS STREETS

PROJECT NO. 2015-06

OCTOBER 13, 2015

soper: APAC ~Missony e
ADDRESS: |59/ [Zuthesulle EO/-,- G, 10
TELEPHONE NUMBER: S 73~ 9Y9- 0§51
DATE: _/{) / 2 7/ /S

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




PROPOSAL

TO THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI:

Pursuant to and in compliance with the Notice to Contractors and having examined the plans and
specifications with related documents and the site(s) of the proposed work, the undersigned bidder proposes
and agrees, if this proposal is accepted, to furnish all labor, materials, tools, supplies, equipment and
supervision and to do all other work necessary for the MILL. AND OVERLAY OF VARIOUS
STREETS, Project 2015~ 06 dated October 13, 2015, as noted in these contract documents for the

following price(s):

Item Estimated

No. Description Unit Quantity UnitCost Amount
MADISON: HWY 50 TO 16™ ST
2'x6’ Edge Milling of Asphalt sY 3500 | 322 []1,200
2" Overlay TON 1,000 | g6 52 86, S00
ASSOCIATED BASE FAILURE REPAIRS sSY 500137 42 /84 700

Item Estimated

No. ALTERNATE #1 Unit Quantity UnitCost Amount
MADISON: HWY 50 TO 12™ ST
Remove 4* Rock Base in Trench and Compact sY 1300 | & 52 8‘/ 50
Replace with 4" Asphalt TON 300 |86 22 |as) 956

/16, 400 =
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID: § Z

o0
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ALTERNATE: §_ 3 'f 400 —

In the event that additions to the work covered by this proposal are required, the undersigned hereby
proposes and agrees that the following unit prices will prevail for the following additions:

Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following addenda, which has been considered in the preparation

of this bid:

Addendum No. /'/ / A

Dated:

The undersigned agrees, if this proposal is accepted, to complete the work BY JANUARY 1, 2015,
PLEASE KEEP IN MIND WHEN ASPHALT PLANTS WILL BE CLOSING DUE TO

WEATHER.

NAME OF BIDDER: HPAC - M issoony |

L Lac

BY: /Zf/*/,/%’

TITLE: 7 Estimdte

ADDRESS: /5¢/ FPutleso llc lza( Columbie, M0

DATE: Jo /7 / /S

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




CONTRACT AGREEMENT

STATE OF MISSOURI
COUNTY OF PETTIS

THIS AGREEMENT AND INDENTURE MADE AND ENTERED INTO THIS, the day
of , 2015 by and between the CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI.

Party of the first part, termed in this agreement and the Contract Documents as the “CITY?, and
Party of the second part, termed in this agreement and the Contract Documents
as the “CONTRACTOR™.

WITNESSETH:

THAT, WHEREAS, the City has heretofore caused to be prepared certain contract documents for
furnishing material, personnel and performing work therein fully described, and the Contractor did,
on the day of , 2015 file with the City a copy of said contract documents
together with his offer and proposal to furnish said material and perform said wotk at the terms
therein fully stated and set forth; and,

WHEREAS, the said contract documents accurately and fully described the terms and conditions
upon which the contractor is willing to furnish the materials, personnel and perform the work called
for by the said contract documents and in the manner and time of furnishing and performing same,

IT 1S, THEREFORE, AGREED:

1. That a copy of said contract documents filed as aforesaid be attached hereto and that the
same do in all particulars become the agreement and contract between the parties hereto in all
matters and things set forth therein and described; and further, that both parties hereby accept and
agree to the terms and conditions of said contract documents so filed for the MILL AND
OVERLAY OF VARIOUS STREETS, Project 2015-06, dated October 13, 2015,

2. The Contract Documents hereto annexed are made a part of this agreement and contract as
fully and absolutely as if herein set out. .

3. That the wages paid under this contract shall be not less than the prevailing rate of wages as
determined by the Missouri State Division of Labor Standards.

4. This contract is executed in three (3) copies.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




IN WITNESS WHEREQF, the parties hereto have executed this contract on the day and year in this

agreement first above written.

ATTEST:

City Clerk

SEAL

(If a corporation)

ATTEST:

Secretary

(CORPORATE SEAL)

(If an individual or partnership)

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI
(Party of the first part)

BY:
Gary Edwards
City Administrator

SIGNATURE OF CONTRACTOR
(Party of the second part)

CONTRACTOR:

BY:

(Name & Title)

CONTRACTOR:

BY:

(Name & Title)

CounciIAgenda




STATE OF

COUNTY OF

On this day of , 2015 before me personally appeared

to me known to be the person

described in and who executed the foregoing instrument and acknowledged that he/she executed the

same as his/her free act and deed.

~ In Testimony Whereof, I have heréunto set my hand and affixed my official seal at my office

in , the day and year first above written.

Notary Public

My Commission Expires:

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




AFFIDAVIT

COMPLIANCE WITH THE WORK AUTHORIZATION LAW
(as required by Section 285.530, Revised Statutes of Missouri)

As used in this Affidavit, the following terms shall have the following meanings:

EMPLOYEE:
Any person performing work or service of any kind or character for hire within the State of
Missouri.

FEDERAIL WORK AUTHORIZATION PROGRAM:
Any of the electronic verification of work authorization programs operated by the United
States Department of Homeland Security or an equivalent federal work authorization
program operated by the United States Department of Homeland Security to verify
information of newly hired employee, under the Immigration Reform and Control Act of
1986 (IRCA), P.L. 99-603.

KNOWINGLY:
A person acts knowingly or with knowledge,
(a) with respect to the person’s conduct or to attendant circumstances when the person is
aware of the nature of the person’s conduct or that those circumstances exist; or
(b)  with respect to a result of the person’s conduct when the person is aware that the
person’s conduct is practically certain to cause that result.

UNAUTHORIZED ALIEN:
An alien who does not have the legal right or authorization under federal law to work in the
United States, as defined in 8 U.S.C. 1324a(h)(3).

Before me, the undersigned Notary Public, in and for the County of , State
of , personally came and appeared
(Name)
, of the ,
(Position) (Name of the Company)

(a corporation) (a partnership) (a proprietorship) and after being duly sworn did depese and say that
all provisions and requirements set out in Chapter 285.530 (2) Missouri Revised Statutes, have been
fully satisfied and there has been no exception to the full and complete compliance with said

provisions and requirements.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




Contractor is enrolled in and participates in a federal work authorization program with
respect to the employees working in connection with the following services confracted between

Contractor and

. Contractor does not knowingly employ any person who is an unauthorized alien in
connection with the contracted services set forth above.

Attached hereto is documentation affirming Contractor’s enrollment and participation in a

federal work authorization program with respect to the employees working in connection with the

contracted services.

MILL AND OVERLAY OF VARIOUS STREETS, PROJECT NO. 2015-06 located at in

Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri, and completed on the day of 2015.
(Signature)
Subscribed and sworn to me this day of ,2015.
My Commission expires:
Notary Public

PLEASE NOTE:
Acceptable enrollment and participation documentation consists of the following 2 pages of the E-
Verify Memorandum of Understanding:
(1) A valid, completed copy of the first page identifying the Contractor; and
(2) A valid copy of the signature page completed and signed by the Contractor, the Social
Security Administration, and the Department of Homeland Security — Verification
Division.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE CALLING A GENERAL ELECTION TO BE HELD ON APRIL 5, 2016
FOR THE PURPOSE OF ELECTING A MUNICIPAL JUDGE AND ONE COUNCILMAN
FROM EACH OF THE FOUR WARDS IN THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. A municipal non-partisan general election shall be held on Tuesday, April 5, 2016 in the
City of Sedalia, Missouri for the purpose of electing a Municipal Judge and one Councilman from each
of the four wards in the City of Sedalia, Missouri.

Section 2. The said municipal general election shall be held in accordance with the laws of the
State of Missouri and the ordinances of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, and the said election shall be
conducted by the County Clerk of Pettis County, Missouri. Filing of declarations of candidacy may
begin on December 15, 2015 at 8:00 a.m. and will be accepted, thereafter Monday through Friday
excluding holidays, from 8:30 a.m. until 5:00 P.M. on January 19, 2016 at the City Clerk’s office.

Section 3. At or before 5:00 P.M. on January 26, 2016, the City Clerk shall give notice of the said
municipal general election to the County Clerk, including a sample ballot for the said municipal
general election duly certifying the candidates at the said election.

Section 4. This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force and effect from and after its passage
by the City Council and approval by the Mayor.

Read two times by title, copies of the proposed ordinance having been made available for public
inspection prior to the time the bill is under consideration by the Council and passed by the Council of
the City of Sedalia, Missouri this 2" day of November, 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 2" day of November, 2015.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor

ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE IV OF THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA RELATING TO BUILDING CODES.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-113, 10-114 and 10-115 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-113. Adoption of Building Codes

The International Building Code, 2015 Edition, and the International Residential Code, 2015
Edition, of the International Code Council are the official building codes of the city and are
incorporated herein by reference, except Appendixes and as amended in this article.

Section 10-114. Amendments — Building Code
The International Building Code, 2015 edition is hereby amended:
(1) Section 101.1 is hereby modified, changed and amended to read as follows:

- "Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of Sedalia, Missouri,

"nn

hereinafter referred to as "this code".
(2) Section 105.1.1, Annual permit, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
(3) Section 105.1.2, Annual permit records, is hereby repealed in its entirety.

(4) [Section] 105.2, Work exempt from permit, Building item 1 is hereby modified, changed and
amended to read:

"One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar
uses, provided the floor area is not greater than 200 square feet."

(5) Section 423, Storm Shelters, is hereby repealed in its entirety.

(6) Section 1015.9 is hereby created to read as follows:

"Horizontal balusters. Shall be prohibited in locations where guards are required.”
(7) Section 1612.3 is hereby created to read as follows:

"Establishment of Flood Hazard Areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the governing body shall
adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. The flood hazard map shall include, at a
minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified by the Federal Emergency Management
Agency in an engineering report entitled "The Flood Insurance Study for the City of Sedalia,

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Missouri," latest edition of the flood map, as amended or revised with the accompanying Flood
Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) and flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related
supporting data along with any revisions thereto. The adopted flood hazard map and supporting
data are hereby adopted by reference and declared to be part of this section.”

(8) Appendix. Amended by deleting in their entirety all chapters.

Section 10-115. Amendments — Residential Code

The International Residential Code, 2015 edition is hereby amended:

(1) Section R101.1, "Title. These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One-
and Two-Family Dwellings of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, and shall be cited as such and will

be hereinafter referred to as "this code".

(2) Table R301.2(1), Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria, is hereby modified, changed, and
amended as follows:

Ground Snow load | , | | 20péf
Wind Design Speed 115 mph
prographic effecté | N No
" ’Win‘d Design Special Wind Région : No
| ‘Wind Design Wind-borne debris zone ; | | No
| ‘Seismic Design Category B |
Subject fo Damage from Weathering | | g Severe
- Subj éét fo Damage ‘from Frost line depth 32"
’Su‘bjre‘ct fo D”arhage from Termite | Modéra’t’év ’to‘ Heavy |
Winter Design Témperatufe ” 5°F
o vIcevBarrier Underiaym‘ent Required | | ”No
R Flood Hazards Januafy 5, 1996
Air Freezing Indéx 1054
| Mean Aﬁnuél Temp . 55v.3~°-F“ R

(3) Section R313.3 is hereby created to read as follows:

"A builder of one- or two-family dwellings or townhouses shall offer to any purchaser on or
before the time of entering into the purchase contract the option, at the purchaser's cost, to install
or equip fire sprinklers in the dwelling or townhouse, pursuant to the provisions of Section
67.281.1 of the Revised Statutes of Missouri."

(4) Section R310.1.5, Emergency Escape and Rescue Required; sleeping room definition, is
hereby added to read as follows:

CouncilAgenda

Pre-CouncilAgenda




"For the purposes of this Section, "Sleeping Room" is defined to mean any room in the dwelling
that is greater than 70 square feet and has a built in closet space and typically could [be] used as a
bedroom. This does not include rooms used for cooking, eating, family living or gathering and
excludes bathrooms, toilet rooms, halls, storage, utility and workshop space and all
unconditioned space.”

(5) Chapter 11, Energy Efficiency, is hereby deleted in its entirety
(6) Section P2603.5.1, Amended by inserting, "12" in two locations where [number] is shown.
(7) Section P2904.8.3 is hereby created to read as follows:

"A builder of one- or two-family dwellings or townhouses shall offer to any purchaser on or
before the time of entering into the purchase contract the option, at the purchaser's cost, to install
or equip fire sprinklers in the dwelling or townhouse, pursuant to the provisions of Section
67.281.1 of the Revised Statutes of Missouri."

(8) Seismic Design. Pursuant to Section 319.203, RSMO, no provision of the International
Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings requiring seismic design and construction
provisions shall apply to any single-family or duplex residence.”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
‘be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2" day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Editions of the International Building Code
and International Residential Code were filed with and were made available to the public at the
City Clerk’s Office for public use, inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to
ihe meeilng ai which ihe second reading of this biii occurred.

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1* day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE VII ELECTRICAL CODE OF
THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 10-204 1s amended to read as follows:

“Section 10-204. Adoption by Reference

(a) Code adopted. The 2014 edition of the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70, 2005) adopted by
the National Fire Protection Association on August 21, 2013, except for annexes A, B, C, D, E,
F,G,H,LJ.

(b) Amended. The following additions, deletions, and amendments are hereby incorporated in
the electrical code adopted in subsection (a) of this section:

(1) All buildings or structures declared and posted as substandard or dangerous buildings due to
electrical conditions, must if reconstructed, be brought up to passable standards and be wired in
accordance with the present electrical code.

(2) All buildings or structures damaged by fire due to electrical conditions shall be inspected by
an established electrical company having an existing electrical contracting license with the city
before electrical power is reconnected or turned on.

Section 210.8(A)(2)(a) is hereby created to read:

"A non-GFCI protected, 125 volt, single phase, 15 or 20 amp single receptacle shall be permitted
for the ceiling-mounted garage door opener, unless the manufacturer requires the garage door
opener to be GFCI protected.”

(3) Section 210.8(A)(5)(a) is hereby created to read:

"A non-GFCI protected, 125 volt, single phase, 15 or 20 amp single receptacle shall be permitted
for the gas water heater power vent when installed in a dwelling unit unfinished basement, unless
the manufacturer requires the power vent to be GFCI protected."

(4) Section 230.79 (D) All Others. is hereby modified to read:

“For all other installations, the service disconnecting means shall have a rating of not less than 60
amperes with a main breaker.”

(5) Section 250.52(A)(1). Section 250.52(A)(1), Metal Underground Water Pipe, is not
permitted as a grounding electrode in new construction. In existing construction, Metal

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Underground Water Pipe shall be discontinued as a grounding electrode upon renovation or
upgrade of the electrical system or service, and shall be replaced with additional electrodes, at the
discretion of the Electrical Inspector, providing resistance as specified in NEC 250.56.

(6) Section 250.70(2) is hereby modified to read:

"Two (2) listed bolted clamps of cast bronze or brass, or plain or malleable iron."”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2014 Edition of the National Electrical Code were
filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s Office for public use,
inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at which the second
reading of this bill occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1% day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1% day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE V EXISTING BUILDING
CODE OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-144 and 10-145 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-144. Adoption by Reference

The International Existing Building Code, 2015 Edition, is the official existing building code of
the city and is incorporated herein by reference, except Appendixes and as amended in this
article.

Section 10-114. Amendments

The following sections of the International Existing Building Code, 2015 edition, are hereby
amended, deleted, or added as follows:

(D Section 101.1, Title, is hereby modified, changed and amended to read as follows:
"Title. These regulations shall be known as the Existing Building Code of the City of Sedalia,

nn

Missouri, hereinafter referred to as "this code".

2 Section 103.1. Delete the words "code official" and insert: "chief building official." All
reference to the "code official" as stated throughout this International Existing Building Code,
shall hereby read "the chief building official.”

(3) Section 105.1.1, Annual permits, is hereby repealed in its entirety.

4) Section 105.1.2, Annual permit records, is hereby repealed in its entirety.”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Editions of the International Existing
Building Code were filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s Office
for public use, inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at which
the second reading of this bill occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1* day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Cierk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 24, ARTICLE II FIRE PREVENTION CODE
OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 24-25 and 24-26 are amended to read as follows:

“Section 24-25. Adoption by Reference

The International Fire Code, 2015 edition, together with appendixes B, C, and D, of the
International Code Council, Inc., is the official fire code of the city and is incorporated herein by
reference.

Section 24-26. Amendments

The following sections of the International Fire Code, 2015 edition, are hereby amended, deleted
or added as follows:

(1) Appendices. The following appendixes are adopted in their entirety:
a. Appendix B, "Fire Flow Requirements For Buildings."

b. Appendix C, "Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution."

c. Appendix D, "Fire Apparatus Access Roads."

(2) Section 101.1. Amended by inserting: "City of Sedalia, Missouri".

(3) Section 108, Board of appeals. Amended by repealing section in its entirety and inserting:
"All appeals shall be conducted as set forth by division 3 of article VI of chapter 2, board of
appeals, of the Sedalia City Code."

(4) Section 109.4. Amended by inserting: ". . . unlawful act, offense, or misdemeanor . . .
$500.00 . . . three months, . . ."

(5) Section 111.4. Amended by deleting: " . . ., shall be liable to a fine of not less than [amount]
dollars or more than [amount] dollars."

(6) Section 111.4. Amended by inserting ". . . shall be liable to a fine as allowed by Section 1-14
of the Code of Ordinances, City of Sedalia, Missouri."

(7) Chapter 2 section 202 General definition. The term "Code Official" is hereby amended to

read fire.chieforhisdesiones
Teac mre Cnili Or IS Gesignee.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




(8) Section 5504.3.1.1.3. Amended by inserting: "Storage of 'Flammable Cryogenic Fluids'is .
prohibited except in Zoning District M-2, Heavy Industrial.”

(9) Section 5704.2.9.6.1. Amended by deleting first paragraph and inserting, "Storage of 'class I
and II liquids' in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited except in Zoning District
M-2, Heavy Industrial.”

(10) Section 5706.2.4.4. Amended by deleting first paragraph and inserting, "Storage of class I
and II liquids in aboveground tanks is prohibited except in Zoning District M-2, Heavy
Industrial."

(11) Section 6104.2. Amended by adding to first paragraph. "The storage of liquefied petroleum
gas is prohibited except in Zoning District M-2, Heavy Industrial."”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick -
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Edition of the International Fire Code were
filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s Office for public use,
inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at which the second
reading of this bill occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1% day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE VI MECHANICAL CODE OF THE
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-174 and 10-175 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-174. Adoption by Reference

The 2015 edition of the International Mechanical Code of the International Code Council, Inc., is
hereby adopted and is incorporated herein by reference, excluding all references to the ICC Electrical
Code, the International Energy Conservation Code, and the International Private Sewage Disposal
Code and also excluding in their entirety all appendices. All references to the International Code
Council Electrical Code Administrative Procedures shall read and mean the currently adopted edition
of the National Electrical Code.

Section 10-175. Amendments

The following sections of the International Mechanical Code, 2015 edition, are hereby amended,
deleted, or added as follows:

(1) Section 101.1. Insert: "City of Sedalia, Missouri."

(2) Section 103.1. Delete: the first paragraph and inserting: All mechanical inspections shall be
conducted by the building safety department and the executive official in charge thereof shall be known
as the chief building official. All references to the "code official" as stated throughout this International
Mechanical Code, shall hereby read "the chief building official."

(3) Section 106.5.3. Insert: in two locations: 80 percent.

(4) Section 108.4. Delete: the penalty provision and substituting. Any violations of the provision of
this Code shall subject the violator to penalties as provided in_section 1-14 of the Sedalia Code of
Ordinances.

(5). Section 108.5. Delete: the penalty provision and substituting. Any violations of the provision of
this Code shall subject the violator to penalties as provided in_section 1-12 of the Sedalia Code of
Ordinances and inserting: ". . . shall be liable to a fine as allowed by section 1-14 of the Code of
Ordinances, City of Sedalia, Missouri."

(6) Section 109. Repeal section in its entirety and insert: section 109.1, application for appeal. "All
appeals shall be conducted as set forth by division 3 of article VI of chapter 2, board of appeals, of the
Code of Ordinances, City of Sedalia, Missouri."”

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance be
declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the remaining
sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City Clerk
and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick Regional
Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this bill was first
read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of November
2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Edition of the International Mechanical Code were
filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s Office for public use, inspection
and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at which the second reading of this bill
occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s Office
and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the Boonslick Regional
Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this bill was read for
the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri,
this 1¥ day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE VIII PLUMBING AND GAS
CODE OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-227 and 10-228 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-227. Adoption by reference of plumbing and gas code.

The 2015 edition of the International Plumbing Code and 2015 edition of the International Fuel
Gas Code of the International Code Council, Inc., are hereby adopted and are therefore the
Official Plumbing and Gas Codes of the City of Sedalia and are incorporated herein by reference,
excluding all references to the ICC Electrical Code, the International Energy Conservation Code,
the International Private Sewage Disposal Code and also excluding in their entirety all
appendixes. All references to the International Code Council Electrical Code Administrative
Procedures shall read and mean the currently adopted edition of the National Electrical Code.

Section 10-228. Amendments to plumbing and gas code

The following sections of the International Plumbing Code (IPC), 2015 edition, and the
International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), 2015 edition, are hereby amended, deleted, or added as
follows:

(1) IPC and IFGC section 101.1. Amended by inserting: "City of Sedalia, Missouri."

(2) IPC and IFGC section 103.1. Amended by deleting paragraph and inserting, "All inspections
shall be conducted by the building safety department and the executive official in charge thereof
shall be known as the chief building official." All references to the "code official" as stated
throughout this Code, shall hereby read "the chief building official."

(3)IPC and IFGC section 106.6.2. Amended by inserting: As per section 10-255, Fees, of the
Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia, Missouri.

(4) IPC and IFGC section 106.6.3. Amended by inserting in two locations: 80 percent.

(5) IPC and IFGC section 108.4. Amended by deleting the penalty provision and substituting.
Any violations of the provision of this Code shall subject the violator to penalties as provided in
section 1-14 of the Sedalia Code of Ordinances.

(6) IPC and IFGC section 108.5. Amended by deleting: ". . . shall be liable to a fine of not less
than [amount] dollars or more than [amount] dollars.” And inserting: ". . . shall be liable to a fine
as allowed by section 1-14 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Sedalia, Missouri."

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




(7) IPC and IFGC section 109. Amended by repealing section in its entirety and inserting,
"Section 109.1 Application for Appeal." All appeals shall be conducted as set forth in division 3
of article VI of chapter 2, "board of appeals, "of the Code of Ordinances, City of Sedalia,
Missouri."

(8) IPC section 305.4.1. Amended by inserting, "12" in two locations where [number] is shown.

(9) IPC section 608.1. Amended by adding additional sentences: "City of Sedalia, Missouri,
Ordinance 8798, approved September 7, 1993, provides for the control and protection of the
public potable water system of the city. The provisions of the ordinance are located in article III
of_chapter 60 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, which takes precedent
over the provisions stated by this Code and are enforced by the water purveyor as per ordinance."

(10) IPC sections 608.17 through 608.17.8. Amended by deleting these sections in their entirety
and inserting: Section 608.17, Protection of individual water supplies. All individual water
supplies (wells) are governed by the Missouri State Statutes and are inspected by the state. A
copy of the Missouri State Inspection Report shall be submitted to the chief building official for
all individual water supplies.

(11) TPC section 701.2. Amended by deleting reference to "The International Private Sewage
Disposal Code," and inserting ". . . Missouri State Statutes govern private sewage disposal
systems and are inspected by the state. A copy of the Missouri State Inspection Report shall be
submitted to the chief building official for all private waste disposal systems."

(12) IPC section 706.3. Amended by changing Table 706.3 by deleting: The "Xa" shown in the
horizontal-to-horizontal column for quarter bend and short sweep fittings, and inserting
additional footnote, "d. Quarter bend and short sweep fittings are not allowed to be used in
horizontal-to-horizontal change in direction for all sizes of pipe."

(13) IPC section 903.1. Amended by inserting: "six" where [number] is shown.

(14) IPC section 1101.1. Amended by inserting additional sentence: Surface water runoff
management is governed by article III of chapter 22 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of
Sedalia, Missouri.”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval. :

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Editions of the International Plumbing Code
and International Fuel Gas Code were filed with and were made available to the public at the
City Clerk’s Office for public use, inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to
the meeting at which the second reading of this bill occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1* day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE X, DIVISION 2
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE OF THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-412 and 10-413 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-412. Adoption by Reference

The International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 edition, of the International Code Council is
the official property maintenance codes of the city and is incorporated herein by reference except
as amended in this division and only to the extent that the provisions of the adopted code are not
in conflict with state law.

Section 10-413. Amendments

The following sections of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 edition, are hereby
amended, deleted, or added as follows:

(H) Section 101.1. Amended by inserting: "City of Sedalia, Missouri."
2) Section 103.5. Amended by inserting: Table T103.5.

3) Section 202. Amended to read: "RUBBISH. Combustible and noncombustible waste
materials, except garbage; the term shall include the residue from the burning of wood, coal,
coke and other combustible materials, paper, rags, cartons, boxes, wood, excelsior, rubber,
leather, tree branches, yard trimmings, tin cans, metals, mineral matter, glass, crockery, dust and
other similar materials and furniture and appliances originally manufactured for indoor use being
used in an outdoor setting."

4) Section 302.4. Amended to read as follows: "All premises and exterior property shall be
maintained free from weeds or plant growth in excess of eight (8) inches. All noxious weeds
shall be prohibited. Weeds shall be defined as all grasses, annual plants and vegetation, other
than trees or shrubs provided; however, this term shall not include cultivated flowers and
gardens.

Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of a property to cut and destroy weeds after 15
days have passed after service of a notice of violation, they shall be subject to prosecution in
accordance with Section 106.3 and as prescribed by the authority having jurisdiction. Upon
failure to comply with the notice of violation, any duly authorized employee of the jurisdiction or
comiractor hired by the jurisdiciion shali be auihorized io enter upon ihe property in vioiation and

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




cut and destroy the weeds growing thereon, and the costs of such removal shall be paid by the
owner or agent responsible for the property."

5) Section 302.4.1, Diseased, Aged Trees, or Shrubs. To be added to read as follows: "All
premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from trees or shrubs that are diseased,
injured, aged, or any other condition that makes it likely for such trees or shrubs or branch
thereof to fall, whereby injury or damage might be caused to some person or neighboring
structure or improvement."

(6) Section 302.4.2, Trees or Shrubs Overhanging Streets and Sidewalks. To be added to read
as follows: "All premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from trees or shrubs or
any limb or branch thereof, that overhang any sidewalk, street, or other public place, or which
has become likely to fall on or across any such public way or place. Any such tree or shrub, or
any limb or branch thereof, described in this section shall be trimmed or removed by the owner
or occupier of the premises on which such tree or shrub grows in order to remove such
condition."

(7 Section 302.8. Amended by adding the following: "The parking of vehicles on
unimproved areas of yards, as defined in section 66-1 of the Sedalia Code of Ordinances, is
hereby declared a public nuisance and unlawful. For the purpose of this section, unimproved
areas are those not paved in some manner, with such materials as concrete, asphalt, gravel, brick,
or cobblestone, so as to prevent the creation of dirt, dust, and ruts. Land covered with vegetation,
such as grass, or that portion of a paved area which exceeds 24 feet in width, is considered an
unimproved area."

(8) Section 304.14. Amended by inserting: May 1 to October 1.
©)] Section 602.3. Amended by inserting: October 1 to May 1.
(10)  Section 602.4. Amended by inserting: October 1 to May 1.”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Edition of the International Property
Maintenance Code were filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s
Office for public use, inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at
which the second reading of this bill occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1% day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CounciIAgenda




| Office of the Mayor

TO: Members of City Council

FROM: Mayor Stephen Galliher

DATE: October 28, 2015

RE: Appointments to City Boards and Commissions /

I would like to make the following recommendations:

New appointments:

BOARD MEMBER TERM

Rick Adams Completing
1321 W. Broadway Larry Billingsley’s Term
Expiring 06-2016

BOARD MEMBER TERM
Ann Richardson Completing
3207 S. Stewart Avenue Chris Patton’s Term
Expiring 06-2018
Kevin Wade Completing
2222 West 2™ Street La Vera Schmitt’s Term
Expiring 06-2019

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




Vendor Name
Al's Portable Welding
Al's Portable Welding
Andrew Burt
Andrew Bunt
Apac-Missouri inc
Apac-Missouri Inc
Apac-Missouri Inc
Apac-Missouri Inc
Apac-Missouri Inc
AT&T
AT&T
B & P Excavating
Bichsel Jewelry
'Bings Waest
Black Gold Rubber Recyclers LLC
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Boone Quarries
Bryant Motor Co
Bryant Motor Co
Bryant Motor Co
Bryant Motor Co
Buso's AA Muffler Shop
Champion Brands LLC
Champion Brands LLC
Champion Brands LLC
Charter Communications
Charter Communications
Charter Communications
Charter Communications
Charter Communications
Charter Communications
Charter Communications

Charter Communications

Pre-CouncilAgenda

City of Sedalia
Department Bills 11-02-2015

Invoice Number
4746
4761
1015A
1015B
9000283036
9000283283
9000283309
9000283519
90002838399
1115A
1115B
2517
001-131064
16
958315
200369
201350
201417
202030
202031
202032
202033
202034
202035
202036
202037
131350
131455
87814
88448
6078
488863
489629
79937
0915-13
1015-11
1015-12A
1015-12D
1015-13
1015-14
1015-MUNI
1115-12B
379200076

G P P F P P D D P A A B R D A B A R D D S N R D D ) A LA R A B L R Eh LB LD D P P P Y

Amount
150.00
40.00
411.02
138.00
149.60
297.84
425.00
13,169.56
550.80
81.78
212.44
5,170.00
167.00
62.09
181.50
55.70
309.81
162,360.00
2,331.03
373.58
3,965.62
205.29
187.38
544.50
44.19
2,900.30
52.92
51.84
50.00
549.15
15.00
461.45
801.67
(40.00)
211.98
24458
80.00
170.72
212.69
80.00
215.00
101.74
813.00

CounciIAgenda




Vendor Name
Cintas Corp #379
Cintas Corp #379
Clark's Tool & Equipment
Clark's Tool & Equipment
Clark's Tool & Equipment
Clark's Tool & Equipment
Conrad Fire Equipment Inc
Consolidated Electrical Distributors Inc.
Crescent Parts & Equipment
Crescent Parts & Equipment
Crescent Parts & Equipment
Crescent Parts & Equipment
Crown Power & Equipment Co
Denise Bryant
Ed M Feld Equip Co Inc.
Ed M Feld Equip Co Inc.
Employee Screening Service Lic
Fastenal Company
Fischer Concrete Service Inc
Fischer Concrete Service Inc
Fischer Concrete Service Inc
Fischer Concrete Service Inc
Foley Industries
Forklifts Of Central Missouri Inc
Gilmore & Bell
Goosen Electric Inc
Hach Company
Halsen Products Company
Hillyard - Columbia
Hillyard - Columbia
House Of Vacuums
I-Land Internet Services
I-Land Internet Services
I-Land Internet Services
I-Land Internet Services
I-Land Internet Services
I-Land Internet Services
I-Land Internet Services
IMKO Workforce Solutions
IMKO Workforce Solutions
IMKO Workforce Solutions
Insight Public Sector
Insight Public Sector

Pre-CouncilAgenda

City of Sedalia
Department Bills 11-02-2015

invoice Number
379201062
379202039
168738
177161
163160
168682
502469
8075-503133
24001022-00
24001143-00
24001162-00
2400877-00
4529101
1015
0286219-IN
0286391-IN
182085
MOSED155801
28222
28223
28460
28461
P5440013124
50052212
34335
3888
9608746
0125761
601824094
601824121
50460
1750627
1750628
1746053
1748030
1748031
1748032
1752098
106830
106831
107026
1100442503
1100443483

LR R R SR AR - S R - A -2 I - A A~ - - - A I A - A R R i R A i AR R i R A B B T R T SRS

Amount
822.21
817.30

28.60
8.26
0.51

17.10

46.54

70.68

38.74

16.53

13.70

10.30

111.00
71.25
245.00
39.15
140.00
65.80
122.52
341.71
1,060.89
613.25
12.19
166.55
5,300.00
726.31
207.34
4,137.00
350.94
257.01

38.85

59.95
3.99

17.05

3495
4.32
5.00

(1.65)
200.00
259.20
180.00
948.50
896.79

CounciIAgenda




City of Sedalia
Department Bills 11-02-2015

Vendor Name . Invoice Number Amount
Insight Public Sector 1100445479 $ (948.50)
International Code Council 1000612952 $ 980.00
International Code Council 1000612956 $ 190.00
Jim's Express Tire and Auto 1-86516 $ 46.00
KCP&L 1015-05 $ 128.15
KCP&L 1015-12 $ 375.12
KCP&L 1015-14 $ 19.92
KCP&L 1015-14A $ 19.92
KCP&L 1015-14C $ 111.92
KCP&L 1015-14D $ 92.85
KCP&L 1015-14E $ 49.00
KCP&L 1015-14F $ 175.19
KCP&L 1015-14G $ 17.19
KCP&L 1015-14H $ 596.29
KCP&L 1015-14K $ 17.26
KCP&L 1015-14N $ 40.64
KCP&L 1015-14P $ 29.59
KCP&L 1015-14R $ 30.19
KCP&L 1015-14S $ 31.00
KCP&L 1015-14T $ 30.03
KCP&L 1015-17 $ 27.62
KCP&L 1015-18 $ 889.31
KCP&L 1015-20 $ 602.30
KCP&L 1015-24 $ 19.34
KCP&L 1015-24D $ 18.09
KCP&L 1015-61C $ 1,222.68
KCP&L 1015-61M $ 305.61
KCP&L 1015-65 $ 467.70
KCP&L 1015-Comp $ 538.58
KCP&L 1015-Muni Bldg $ 2,287.67
KCP&L 1015-SL $ 35,446.13
Key Hydraulics 15-38251 $ 748.36
Key Hydraulics 15-38308 $ 638.52
Key Hydraulics 15-38338 $ 8.60
Key Hydraulics 15-38414 $ 535.52
Lea's Truck Service Llc 8554PARTS $ 100.50
Lea's Truck Service Llc 8655PARTS $ 218.90
Lea's Truck Service Llc 8672PARTS $ 35.72
Leon Uniform Co Inc 361533-01 $ 161.50
Leon Uniform Co Inc 362098 $ 92.90
Leona Anson 1015 $ 8.30
Little Big Horn Cattle Company 72200 $ 400.00
M & M Utilities LLC 10202015 $ 600.00

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




Vendor Name
Mailfinance
Manny Rodriguez
Mark Grose
MCI
Medallion Electric inc
Midland Printing Company
Midland Surveying
Missouri Department of Corrections
Mitchelld
Municipal Code Corporation
NAPA Of Sedalia Genuine Parts Company
Nuway Concrete Forms Central
O'Reilly Automotive Inc.
O'Reilly Automotive Inc.
O'Reilly Automotive Inc.
O'Reilly Automotive Inc.
Otten Small Engine Service
Otten Small Engine Service
Otten Small Engine Service
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds
Quicksilver Water
Quicksilver Water
Quicksilver Water
Quicksilver Water
Quicksilver Water
Rac-Jac Properties
Rac-Jac Properties
Rac-Jac Properties
Rac-Jac Properties
Rick Ball Ford - Sedalia
Rick Ball Ford - Sedalia
Rick Ball Ford - Sedalia
Rick Ball Ford - Sedalia
Rick Ball Ford - Sedalia
Ricoh USA Inc
Roberts & Associates

Schriefer's Office Equip Inc

Pre-CouncilAgenda

City of Sedalia
Department Bills 11-02-2015

Invoice Number

N5589531
1015A
1015A
1115
102047
50489

4101

6324
1818099332
00261988
404313
849067
0114-357160
0114-35864
0247-401509
0114-358688
177767
178259
178260
58816
61844
61941

6198
57915
58721
57744
745179
745180
747692
946608
748772
1015-61
1015-12
1015-13
1015-16
137086
137041
137059
137107
82911
5038576351
09018261
278805

B T A R R B R ) R R A B R R A A S O R R AL R B D R h A RO R A Y B Y S A B

Amount
408.45
33.75
93.23
213.06
668.40
44.46
800.00
1,680.00
260.25
2,847.39
257.79
30.79
4.49
76.94
4.49
149.23
80.50
6,463.40
16.00
36.00
315.00
96.00
681.00
39.00
36.00
42.00
13.50
20.00
28.00
34.50
55.50
6.72
18.50
693.84
2450
97.07
149.51
114.14
119.53
102.96
31.99
375.00
264.61

CounciIAgenda




City of Sedalia
- Department Bills 11-02-2015

Vendor Name Invoice Number Amount
Sedatlia Democrat 1015 $ 157.99
Sedalia Downtown Development 1015 $ 750.00
Sedalia Rental & Supply 169200 3 7.50
Sedalia Veterinary Center 1015A $ 42.00
Sherwin Williams Co 4867-3 $ 120.67
SMC Electric Supply 60210903-00 $ 413.25
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 598429 $ 147.33
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 599180-1 $ 6.80
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 599573 $ 141.55
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 599113 $ 48.20
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 599477 $ 92.79
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 599481 $ 241.43
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 599545 $ 54.50
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 597234 $ 197.17
Spray Com Utilities Inc 5 $ 69,552.99
Staples Business Advantage 3280687036 $ 5.89
Staples Business Advantage 3280687090 $ 1,261.93
Staples Business Advantage 3280687091 $ 260.99
Staples Business Advantage 3280687092 $ 169.99
Staples Business Advantage 3280687171 $ 104.93
Staples Business Advantage 3281258514 $ (10.49)
Staples Business Advantage 3281258654 $ 27.76
Stone Laser Imaging 1015A $ 50.00
Tallman Company $135088 $ 85.92
Terminal Supply Co. 57058-00 $ 322.20
The Sedalia Area Chamber Of Commerce  1015A $ 20.00
Tim's Tree Service Lic 4054 $ 500.00
Tim's Tree Service Llc 4112 $ 850.00
Tim's Tree Service Llc 4113 $ 350.00
Tim's Tree Service Llc 4114 $ 200.00
Tim's Tree Service Lic 4115 $ 600.00
Tim's Tree Service Lic 4130 $ 500.00
Tim's Tree Service Lic 4131 $ 200.00
Tim's Tree Service Llc 4136 $ 475.00
Tire Centers Lic 6500148499 $ 122.95
Tire Centers Lic 6500149386 $ 20.00
Tire Centers Lic 6500149542 $ 71.20
Tire Centers Lic 6500149543 $ 583.30
Tire Centers Lic 6500149681 $ 614.36
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc 0231427 $ 20.06
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc 0231680 $ 107.00
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc 0231816 $ 488.88
Usa Biuebook 769368 $ 337.69

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




Vendor Name
Usa Bluebook
Usa Bluebook
USIC Locating Service Inc
Vance Bros. Inc-Kansas City
Verizon Wireless
Viebrock Sales & Service
W & M Welding Inc
Wal-Mart Community/RFCSLLC
Wal-Mart Community/RFCSLLC
Wal-Mart Community/RFCSLLC
Wal-Mart Community/RFCSLLC
Wal-Mart Community/RFCSLLC
Wal-Mart Community/RFCSLLC
Wal-Mart Community/RFCSLLC
Wal-Mart Community/RFCSLLC
Wal-Mart Community/RFCSLLC
Warehouse Tire & Muffler
West Group
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Wilson & Company inc
Wilson & Company Inc
W-K Chevrolet-Buick
Zee Medical Inc
Zee Medical Inc
Total Bills To Be Paid

Pre-CouncilAgenda

City of Sedalia
Department Bills 11-02-2015

Invoice Number

773031
774273
146284

3461
9754222231
1806

44719

00627

00563

02846

05098

08091

08343

08552

08874

09816
190726
832671456
§5249317.001
$§5256555.001
§5259181.001
$5259410.001
§5250355.001
§5253681.001
$5255813.001
$5258008.001
556258547.001
61508

61509
174686
0100031152
0100031153

Amount
26.97
482.18
2,692.92
6,132.92
2,670.33
9.75
65.00
44.07
220.90
45.52
61.86
424
86.01
73.85
5.94
13.54
1,153.88
344.41
186.42
559.26
46.18
69.27
38.46
18.17
47.14
59.77
44.04
2,150.00
1,028.50
53.68
125.45
165.19

NP B & B O B B B B A B P P G P R A B P A h R h S 5 R A A B B P &

381,033.75

CounciIAgenda




	Pre Council

	Council

	Admin Memo

	Oct 19 Pre

	Oct 19 Reg

	Airport Consultant

	Rock

	Mixer Parts

	Demos

	Mill & Overlay Bid

	Records Dest.

	Animal Shelter

	County Road

	Mill & Overlay Ord

	Election

	Bldg Codes

	Electrical Code

	Existing Bldg Code

	Fire Code

	Mechanical Code

	Plumbing& Gas Code

	Prop Mtc Code

	Appointments

	Dept Bills


	PreCouncil Agenda: 
	Council Agenda: 


