Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation
SESY Mayor’s Conference Room
"’ P RE'C O U N C ' L Municipal Building
Monday, February 1, 2016
MEETING : 6:30 p.m.

MAYOR: STEPHEN J. GALLIHER MAYOR PRO-TEM: JO LYNN TURLEY

Work Session — 6:30 p.m.

Committee Meetings — Immediately following work session

PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE ‘Russell Driskell, Chair
Police and Fire Vicky Collins, Vice Chair
PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE Tolbert Rowe, Chair
Public Works, Water Pollution Control, Don Meier, Vice Chair

Community Development, Water, Parks,
Airport, Cemeteries and Community Center

1. :Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article IV of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia
relating to building codes (Bill No. 2015-135; Read 1% time November 2, 2015; 2™ Reading)
2. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VII electrical code of the Code of Ordinances of the
City of Sedalia (Bill No. 2015-136; Read 1* time November 2, 2015; 2™ Reading)
3. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article V Existing Building Code of the Code of Ordinances of
_the City of Sedalia (Bill No. 2015-137; Read 1* time November 2, 2015; 2" Reading)
4. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 24, Article II Fire Prevention Code of the Code of Ordinances of
the City of Sedalia (Bill No. 2015-138; Read 1% time November 2, 2015; 2" Reading)
5. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VI Mechanical Code of the Code of Ordinances of the
City of Sedalia (Bill No. 2015-139; Read 1% time November 2, 2015; 2™ Reading)

6. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VIII Plumbing and Gas Code of the Code of
Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (Bill No. 2015-140; Read 1* time November 2, 2015; 2™ Reading)

7. Review Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article X, Division 2 International Property Maintenance Code
of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (Bill No. 2015-141; Read 1* time November 2, 2015;
2" Reading)

8. Review Ordinance approving and accepting a site license and consumption cost agreement by and
between the City of Sedalia, Missouri and Kansas City Power and Light Company (KCP&L), a Missouri
Corporation, for the installation and operation of electric vehicle supply equipment stations on City
owned property

9. Review Ordinance accepting a quit claim deed with associated easement for ingress, egress, public utility
and right-of-way purposes from Thompson Hills Investment Corporation, a Missouri Corporation; Sylvia
G. Thompson Charitable Trust, a Charitable Foundation Trust; and CJ Sedalia, LLC, a Missouri Limited
Liability. Company for Hobby Lobby Drive and Ninth Street and accepting said streets for city
maintenance e

10.Review Ordinance approving and accepting an agreement between the City of Sedalia, Missouri
and Timothy D. Ehlers and Angela M. Ehlers, Husband and Wife, and Tim’s Tree Service LLC

11.Review Resolution of the City Council of the City of Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri declaring a
moratorium on demolition permits on Ohio Avenue between Main Street and Broadway in the City of
Sedalia. Such moratorium to remain in effect for ninety (90) days unless extended or replaced by
amending ordinance or resolution



jmyers
Text Box
Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation 


FINANCE/ADMINISTRATION COMMITTEE James Cunningham, Chair
Administrative, Library and Hospital Bonita Nash, Vice Chair

1. Review Records Destruction Request from Personnel Department

IF YOU HAVE SPECIAL NEEDS, WHICH REQUIRE ACCOMMODATION, PLEASE
NOTIFY THE CITY CLERK’S OFFICE. ACCOMMODATIONS WILL BE MADE FOR
YOUR NEEDS.



=lick on any agenda item to view the related documentation
\ CITY COUNCIL lltflyun(i)cipall Buizllclll;ngerS
MEETING AGENDA  Menda a1, 2016

A. SILENT PRAYER & PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

B. ROLL CALL

C. SERVICE AWARDS
1. Hugo Twenter — Fire Driver — Fire Department — 35 years of service
2. Joseph McCullough — Police Officer — Police Department — 10 years of service
3. Matt Harris — Senior Engineer Technician — Water Pollution Control — 5 years of service

D. SPECIAL AWARDS
1. Retirement — Earl D. Monteer — Sanitation Department — 12 years, 11 months of service

I. MINUTES
1. Pre-Council Meeting January 19, 2016
2. Regular Council Meeting January 19, 2016

I1. UNFINISHED BUSINESS : ,

O Bill No. 2015-135 (Read 1 time November 2, 2015) amending Chapter 10, Article IV of the Code of
Ordinances of the City of Sedalia relating to Building Codes (2™ Reading)

O Bill No. 2015-136 (Read 1* time November 2, 2015) amending Chapter 10, Article VII Electrical Code of the
Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (2™ Reading)

O Bill No. 2015-137 (Read 1* time November 2, 2015) amending Chapter 10, Article V Existing Building Code
of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (2" Reading)

O Bill No. 2015-138 (Read 1* time November 2, 2015) amending Chapter 24, Article I Fire Prevention Code of
the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (2™ Reading) :

O Bill No. 2015-139 (Read 1* time November 2, 2015) amending Chapter 10, Article VI Mechanical Code of the
Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (2™ Reading)

O Bill No. 2015-140 (Read 1* time November 2, 2015) amending Chapter 10, Article VIII Plumbing and Gas
Code of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (2™ Reading)

O Bill No. 2015-141 (Read 1* time November 2, 2015) amending Chapter 10, Article X, Division 2 International
Property Maintenance Code of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia (2™ Reading)

III. REPORT OF SPECIAL BOARDS, COMMISSIONS AND COMMITTEES

IV. ROLL CALL OF STANDING COMMITTEES
A. PUBLIC SAFETY - Councilmember Russell Driskell

B. PUBLIC WORKS - Councilmember Tolbert Rowe

C. FINANCE / ADMINISTRATION —Councilmember James Cunningham
1. ‘Approve Records Destruction Request from the Personnel Department

V. NEW BUSINESS
A. ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS

O Approving and accepting a site license and consumption cost agreement by and between the City of
Sedalia, Missouri and Kansas City Power and Light Company (KCP&L), a Missouri Corporation, for the
installation and operation of electric vehicle supply equipment stations on City owned property.

O Accepting a quit claim deed with associated easement for ingress, egress, public utility and right-of-way
purposes from Thompson Hills Investment Corporation, a Missouri Corporation; Sylvia G. Thompson
Charitable Trust, a Charitable Foundation Trust; and CJ Sedalia, LLC, a Missouri Limited Liability
Company for Hobby Lobby Drive and Ninth Street and accepting said streets for city maintenance.


jmyers
Text Box
Click on any agenda item to view the related documentation 


O Approving and accepting an agreement between the City of Sedalia, Missouri and Timothy D.

Ehlers and Angela M. Ehlers, Husband and Wife, and Tim’s Tree Service LLC
R Declaring a moratorium on demolition permits on Ohio Avenue between Main Street and Broadway in the

City of Sedalia. Such moratorium to remain in effect for ninety (90) days unless extended or replaced by
amending ordinance or resolution

B. APPOINTMENTS

New:
*Appoint — Curt Williams — Airport Board — Completing William Ferguson’s Term Expiring June 2017

*Appoint — Larry Bahr — Airport Board — Completing Ron Ditzfeld’s Term Expiring June 2019

C. LIQUOR LICENSES

New:
*Brian K. Egbert dba Strikerz, 2119 W Broadway, Liquor by Drink with Sunday Sales, $750

‘Renewals:
*Scott Hewett dba Colton’s Steakhouse, 4101 W Broadway, Liquor by Drink with Sunday Sales, $750

*Joseph LeMaire dba LeMaire’s Cajun Catfish, 3500 W Broadway, Liquor by Drink with Sunday Sales,

$750
*Thomas White dba Loyal Order of Moose #1494, 119 Winchester Dr, Sunday Sales, $300

*Ann Grady dba Woods Super Market, Inc., 701 E Broadway, Taste Testing, $37.50
D. APPROVAL OF DEPARTMENT BILLS
MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS FROM MAYOR, CITY COUNCIL AND CITY ADMINISTRATOR
F. GOOD AND WELFARE

G. ADJOURN

IF YOU HAVE SPECIAL NEEDS, WHICH REQUIRE ACCOMMODATION, PLEASE NOTIFY THE CITY
CLERK’S OFFICE. ACCOMMODATIONS WILL BE MADE FOR YOUR NEEDS.



OFFICE OF THE CITY ADMINISTRATOR

To: Honorable Mayor Stephen Gallihg
From: Gary Edwards, City Administra
Re: Agenda items for City Council meeting on Monday, February 1, 2016

(Council Members

This meeting begins at 6:30 PM

Presentations:
1. No Presentations

Public Safety Committee:
1. 'No items

Public Works Committee:

1. Review an Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article IV of the City Building Code. Bill No. 2015-135.
This is the second and final reading of an Ordinance that was first read on November 2, 2015.

2, Review an Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VII of the City Electrical Code. Bill No. 2015-136.
This is the second and final reading of an Ordinance that was first read on November 2, 2015.

3. Review an Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article V of the City Existing Building Code. Bill No. 2015-
137. ‘This is the second and final reading of an Ordinance that was first read on November 2, 2015.

4. Review an Ordinance amending Chapter 24, Article II of the City Fire Prevention Code. Bill No. 2015-
138. This is the second and final reading of an Ordinance that was first read on November 2, 2015.

5. Review an Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VI of the City Mechanical Code. Bill No. 2015-139.
This is the second and final reading of an Ordinance that was first read on November 2, 2015.

6. Review an Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article VIII of the City Plumbing and Gas Code. Bill No.
2015-140. This is the second and final reading of an Ordinance that was first read on November 2, 2015.

7. Review an Ordinance amending Chapter 10, Article X, Division 2 of the City International Property
Maintenance Code. Bill No. 2015-141. This is the second and final reading of an Ordinance that was first
read on November 2, 2015.

8. Review an Ordinance related to a site license and consumption cost agreement between the City and Kan-
sas City Power and Light for the installation and operation of electrlc vehicle supply equipment stations
on City owned property in the parking lot across from City Hall at 2" ¢ and Osage.

9.  Review an Ordinance that accepts a Quit Claim Deed with associated easements for ingress, egress, public
utility and right-of-way purposes from Thompson Hill Investment Corporation; Sylvia G. Thompson
Charitable Trust and CJ Sedalia, LLC, for Hobby Lobby Drive and Ninth Street and accepting these
streets for City Maintenance. Staff recommends approval.

10. Review an Ordinance and agreement between the City and Timothy and Angela Ehlers of Tim’s Tree
Service. This agreement allows the City to have access to the Ehlers’ property to grind up material to be
used in city compost. There is no cost to the City for this agreement.

11. Review Resolution of the City Council declaring a 90 day moratorium on demolition permits on Ohio Av-
enue between Main Street and Broadway. This moratorium allows the City enough time to produce the
legislation needed to protect this historic area from demolitions that impact long-term strategic planning.

Finance/Administration Committee:
1. Review records destruction request from the Personnel Department.

Page one of one

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI
PRE-COUNCIL MEETING — JANUARY 19, 2016

WORK SESSION
The Work Session started at 6:30 p.m. in the Mayor’s Conference Room at the Municipal Building.

Council Members present were James Cunningham, Russell Driskell, Bonita Nash, Donald Meier, Bob
Cross, Tolbert Rowe and Vicky Collins. Jo Lynn Turley arrived at 6:37 p.m.

Presentation — Financial Update

Finance Director, Kelvin Shaw, presented a financial update regarding sales tax and expenditures.
Sales tax for FY 2016 in the month of January is up 3.6% from last year and year to date is up 2.0%.
The budget target is at 4.0%. The City has received two checks from the Use Tax that began in
October 2015 which total $75,901.00.

Fiscal Year-to-Date Expenditures:
e General Government Administration and Support shows an increase of 5.0%
e Public Safety has increased 4.2%
Transportation has increased 5.5%
Library has increased 0.9%
Parks and Recreation shows an increase of 25.1% due to the Community Center Project and
Turf Project at Liberty Stadium
e Projects and Capital Improvements shows a decrease of 38.0% with spend down fund balance
* Year to date 72.7% of budget has been spent

COMMITTEE MEETING
Public Safety Committee — Councilman Driskell, Chairman, presented the following
recommendation: :

e Proposals for IP Based Surveillance System to Custom Communications, Sedalia, MO in the
amount of $14,973.83 - Police Chief, John DeGonia, recommended adding Option 1 in the
amount of $2,398.90 for additional cameras for the municipal building lobby and council
chambers to provide additional security. Motion by Cunningham, seconded by Cross to
include the addition of Option 1, making the total award amount $17,372.73. Item was then
moved to full Council. All in favor.

e Bids on (2) 2016 Dodge Chargers for the Sedalia Police Department to Bryant Motors, Sedalia,
MO in the amount of $47,648.00 ($23,824.00 each; budgeted $52,312.00) was moved to full
Council on motion by Rowe, seconded by Meier. All in favor.

Public Works Committee — Councilman Rowe, Chairman, presented the following recommendations:
¢ Ordinance approving and accepting a permanent utility easement from Michael Lee Fisher and
Katie E. Ray Fisher for sanitary sewer purposes relating to the sewer relief project was moved
to full Council on motion by Cross, seconded by Nash. All in favor.

Pre-CouncilAgenda | CouncilAgenda




Ordinance granting a rezoning application by GUESA USA LLC for property located at 115
W. Broadway (from C-3 Commercial to C-2 General Business District) was moved to full
Council on motion by Driskell, seconded by Meier. All in favor.

Change Order #6 from Spray Com Utilities, Inc., Knob Noster, MO for the Collection System
Rehabilitation Phase 1A Project, Base Bid, Bid Package Number 2 in the amount of $52,300.00
(total contract price $1,343,729.30; adding 38 service connections to scope of work through
excavation) was moved to full Council on motion by Cunningham, seconded by Meier. All in
favor.

Ordinance amending the budget for the Fiscal Year 2015-2016 regarding the Water Pollution
Control Collection System Rehabilitation Phase 1A Project (covers Change Order #6 from
Spray Com Utilities, Inc.) was moved to full Council on motion by Driskell, seconded by Nash.
All in favor.

Finance/Administration Committee — Councilman Cunningham, Chairman, presented the following

recommendation:

Quote from World Wide Technology, Inc., St. Louis, MO for the purchase of replacement
computer equipment in the amount of $12,911.86 through the State of Missouri Cooperative
Procurement Program (Part of IT department replacement program; All computers being
replaced are 4 years or more old; Purchase is for 12 computers, 4 laptops and 5 monitors) was
moved to full Council on motion by Meier, seconded by Nash. All in favor.

City Administrator, Gary Edwards, reminded the Council about the Closed-Door meeting on January
26,2016 at 6:30 p.m. for legal advice.

With no further comments, the meeting closed at 6:43 p.m.
Respectfully submitted: Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




CITY OF SEDALIA. MISSOURI
COUNCIL MEETING — JANUARY 19, 2016

The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri duly met on Tuesday, January 19, 2016, at 7:00 p.m. at the
Municipal Building with Mayor Stephen J. Galliher presiding. Mayor Galliher called the meeting to
order and asked for a moment of silent prayer followed by the Pledge of Allegiance led by Councilman
Turley.

ROLL CALL:

James Cunningham Present Donald Meier Present
Jo Lynn Turley Present Bob Cross Present
Russell Driskell Present Tolbert Rowe Present
Bonita Nash Present Vicky Collins Present
SPECIAL AWARDS:

John R. Collins was presented a retirement watch by Mayor Galliher and a plaque by Police Chief, John
DeGonia, for his 30 years, 8 months of service with the Police Department.

Officer Collins thanked everyone in attendance along with the Sedalia Police Department and added that
in his years of service he was proud of being able to have saved 3 lives. Officer Collins also stated that
he was proud to have attended D.A.R.E. school in 1991 and began with D.A.R.E. at a state level in 1997
as Vice-President, President and is currently serving as State Treasurer. In 2007, Officer Collins was
named D.A.R.E Officer of the Year and has recently traveled to New Jersey where he was able to
instruct new D.A.R.E. Officers. Officer Collins closed by commenting that he will continue with the
Police Department as a reserve officer.

Mayor Galliher asked for the policemen present at the meeting to stand and be recognized for their
service to the community.

MINUTES:

The following minutes were approved on motion by Meier, seconded by Cross. All in favor.
¢  Pre-Council Meeting January 4, 2016
» Regular Council Meeting January 4, 2016
e Strategic Planning Session January 9, 2016

REPORTS OF SPECIAL BOARDS, COMMISSIONS & COMMITTEES.:

The following minutes were approved on motion by Driskell, seconded by Nash. All in favor.
e Citizen’s Traffic Advisory Commission Meeting December 16, 2015
e Planning & Zoning Commission Meeting October 14, 2015

ROLL CALL OF STANDING COMMITTEES:

PUBLIC SAFETY —~ RUSSELL DRISKELL, CHAIRMAN
Awarded proposal for IP Based Surveillance System in the Sedalia Police Department to Custom
Communications, Sedalia, MO in the amount of $14,973.83 with the addition of Option 1 in the amount

1

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




of $2,398.90 making a grand total of $17,372.73 for additional cameras for the Municipal Building
lobby and Council Chambers to provide additional security on motion by Meier, seconded by
Cunningham. All in favor. ~ '

Awarded bid for (2) 2016 Dodge Chargers for the Sedalia Police Department to Bryant Motors, Sedalia,
MO in the amount of $47,648.00 on motion by Cross, seconded by Meier. All in favor.

PUBLIC WORKS — TOLBERT ROWE, CHAIRMAN

Approved Change Order #6 from Spray Com Utilities, Inc. Knob Noster, MO in the amount of
$52,300.00 for the Collection System Rehabilitation Phase lA Project, Base Bid, Bid Package No. 2 on
motion by Meier, seconded by Nash. All in favor.

FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION — JAMES CUNNINGHAM, CHAIRMAN

Approved purchase of replacement computer equipment (12 computers, 4 laptops and 5 monitors) from
World Wide Technology, Inc., St. Louis, MO in the amount of $12,911.86 through the State of Missouri
Cooperative Procurement Program on motion by Rowe, seconded by Driskell. All in favor.

NEW BUSINESS:
BILL NO. 2016 — 03, ORDINANCE NO. 10404 — AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND
ACCEPTING A PERMANENT UTILITY EASEMENT FROM MICHAEL LEE FISHER AND
KATIE E. RAY FISHER FOR SANITARY SEWER PURPOSES RELATING TO THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI SEWER RELIEF PROJECT was read once by title.
2™ Reading — Motion by Rowe, 2" by Cunningham. All in favor.
Final Passage — Motion by Driskell, 2" by Nash. All in favor.
Roll Call Vote: Voting “Yes” were Cunningham, Turley, Driskell, Nash, Meier, Cross, Rowe

and Collins. No one voted “No”.

BILL NO. 2016 — 04, ORDINANCE NO. 10405 — AN ORDINANCE GRANTING A REZONING
APPLICATION BY GUESA USA, LLC FOR PROPERTY LOCATED AT 115 WEST BROADWAY
IN THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI was read once by title.
2 Reading — Motion by Turley, 2" by Nash. All in favor.
Final Passage — Motion by Turley, 2" by Cross. All in favor.
Roll Call Vote: Voting “Yes” were Cunningham, Turley, Driskell, Nash, Meier, Cross, Rowe

and Collins. No one voted “No”.

BILL NO. 2016 — 05, ORDINANCE NO. 10406 — AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE BUDGET
FOR THE FISCAL YEAR 2015-2016 REGARDING THE WATER POLLUTION CONTROL
COLLECTION SYSTEM REHABILITATION PHASE 1A PROJECT was read once by title.
2™ Reading — Motion by Cunningham, 2" by Meier. All in favor.
Final Passage — Motion by Nash, 2" by Turley. All in favor.
Roll Call Vote: Voting “Yes” were Cunningham, Turley, Driskell, Nash, Meier, Cross, Rowe

and Collins. No one voted “No”.

APPOINTMENTS:
The following Board Appointment by Mayor Galliher was read and approved on motion by Driskell,
seconded by Meier. All in favor.

TAX INCREMENT FINANCING (TIF) COMMISSION:
Appoint Michelle Swords, 300 S. Ohio, completing Stafford Swearingen’s term expiring July 2016.

2

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




BIDS:
* P Based Surveillance System — January 5, 2016
e (2) Dodge Chargers — January 11, 2016

LIQUOR LICENSES:
City Attorney, Anne Gardner, stated that the Liquor License for the Ivory Grille is a new license and not
a renewal as was originally listed.

The following New/Renewal Liquor Licenses were read and approved on motion by Rowe, seconded by
Cross. All in favor.

New:
e Erica L. Eisenmenger dba Ivory Grille, LLC, 317 S Ohio — Sunday Sales

Renewal:
e Jenna House dba Tiger Eagle Stop, 3415 E Broadway — Packaged Liquor with Sunday Sales
e Kimberly Allen dba Child Safe of Central Missouri, Inc., 102 E 10" — Picnic License

DEPARTMENT BILLS thru January 19, 2016 totaling $441,749.03 were approved for payment on
motion by Driskell, seconded by Meier. All in favor.

MISCELLANEOUS JTEMS FROM MAYOR/COUNCIL/ADMINISTRATOR: None.

GOOD & WELFARE: None.

The meeting adjourned at 7:18 p.m. to a Closed-Door Session in accordance with Sections 610.021 (1)
& (2) RSMo for Legal Advice and Lease, Sale or Purchase of Real Estate on motion by Meier, seconded

by Nash. All in favor.
THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI
‘//%

/ VStephen J. Galliher, Mayor

///;7 A lpai < (i»(fu’-uﬁ V7% .
ArleneSilvey, MPCC CityClerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




BILLNO.  2015-135

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE 1V OF THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALJA RELATING TO BUILDING CODES.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-113, 10-114 and 10-115 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-113. Adoption of Building Codes

The International Building Code, 2015 Edition, and the International Residential Code, 2015
Edition, of the International Code Council are the official building codes of the city and are
incorporated herein by reference, except Appendixes and as amended in this article.

Section 10-114. Amendments — Building Code
The International Building Code, 2015 edition is hereby amended:
(1) Section 101.1 is hereby modified, changed and amended to read as follows:

"Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of Sedalia, Missouri,
hereinafter referred to as "this code"."

(2) Section 105.1.1, Annual permit, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
(3) Section 105.1.2, Annual permit records, is hereby repealed in its entirety.

(4) [Section] 105.2, Work exempt from permit, Bulldmg item 1 is hereby modified, changed and
amended to read:

"One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar
uses, provided the floor area is not greater than 200 square feet."

(5) Section 423, Storm Shelters, is hereby repealed in its entirety.

(6) Section 1015.9 is hereby created to read as follows:

"Horizontal balusters. Shall be prohibited in locations where guards are required.”
(7) Section 1612.3 is hereby created to read as folloWs:

"Establishment of Flood Hazard Areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the governing body shall
adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. The flood hazard map shall include, at a
minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified by the Federal Emergency Management

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




Agency in an engineering report entitled "The Flood Insurance Study for the City of Sedalia,
Missouri," latest edition of the flood map, as amended or revised with the accompanying Flood
Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) and flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related
supporting data along with any revisions thereto. The adopted flood hazard map and supporting
data are hereby adopted by reference and declared to be part of this section.”

(8) Appendix. Amended by deleting in their entirety all chapters.

Section 10-115. Amendments — Residential Code

The International Residential Code, 2015 edition is hereby amended:

(1) Section R101.1, "Title. These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One-
and Two-Family Dwellings of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, and shall be cited as such and will

nn

be hereinafter referred to as "this code".

(2) Table R301.2(1), Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria, is hereby modified, changed, and
amended as follows:

- Ground Snow load 20psf
”””” Wind Design Speed ‘iAIS mph
Tol;c;‘graphic effects No
B Wind Design Special Wind Region No
Wmd Design Wind-borne debris zoh; - No
Seismic Design Category B
” Subject to Démage from Weathering Severe
Subject to Damage from Frost line depth 32"
Subject to Damage from Termite Moderate to Heavy
)))) Winter Design Temperature 5°F
Ice Barrier Underlayment Required No
Flood Hazards January 5, 1996
Air Freezing Index 1054
Mean Annual Temp 55.3°F

(3) Section R313.3 is hereby created to read as follows:

"A builder of one- or two-family dwellings or townhouses shall offer to any purchaser on or

before the time of entering into the purchase contract the option, at the purchaser's cost, to install

or equip fire sprinklers in the dwelling or townhouse, pursuant to the provisions of Section

67.281.1 of the Revised Statutes of Missouri."

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




(4) Section R310.1.5, Emergency Escape and Rescue Required; sleeping room definition, is
hereby added to read as follows:

"For the purposes of this Section, "Sleeping Room" is defined to mean any room in the dwelling
that is greater than 70 square feet and has a built in closet space and typically could [be] used as a
bedroom. This does not include rooms used for cooking, eating, family living or gathering and
excludes bathrooms, toilet rooms, halls, storage, utility and workshop space and all
unconditioned space."”

(5) Chapter 11, Energy Efficiency, is hereby deleted in its entirety
(6) Section P2603.5.1, Amended by inserting, "12" in two locations where [number] is shown.
(7) Section P2904.8.3 is hereby created to read as follows:

"A builder of one- or two-family dwellings or townhouses shall offer to any purchaser on or
before the time of entering into the purchase contract the option, at the purchaser's cost, to install
or equip fire sprinklers in the dwelling or townhouse, pursuant to the provisions of Section
67.281.1 of the Revised Statutes of Missouri."

(8) Seismic Design. Pursuant to Section 319.203, RSMO, no provision of the International
Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings requiring seismic design and construction
provisions shall apply to any single-family or duplex residence.”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2" day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

- I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Editions of the International Building Code
and International Residential Code were filed with and were made available to the public at the

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




. City Clerk’s Office for public use, inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to
the meeting at which the second reading of this bill occurred.
1 also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1% day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




BILLNO. 2015 —136

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE VII ELECTRICAL CODE OF
THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 10-204 is amended to read as follows:

“Section 10-204. Adoption by Reference

(a) Code adopted. The 2014 edition of the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70, 2005) adopted by
the National Fire Protection Association on August 21, 2013, except for annexes A, B, C, D, E,
F,G,H,LJ.

(b) Amended. The following additions, deletions, and amendments are hereby incorporated in
the electrical code adopted in subsection (a) of this section:

(1) All buildings or structures declared and posted as substandard or dangerous buildings due to
electrical conditions, must if reconstructed, be brought up to passable standards and be wired in
accordance with the present electrical code.

(2) All buildings or structures damaged by fire due to electrical conditions shall be inspected by
an established electrical company having an existing electrical contracting license with the city
before electrical power is reconnected or turned on.

Section 210.8(A)(2)(a) is hereby created to read:

"A non-GFCI protected, 125 volt, single phase, 15 or 20 amp single receptacle shall be permitted
for the ceiling-mounted garage door opener, unless the manufacturer requires the garage door
opener to be GFCI protected."”

(3) Section 210.8(A)(5)(a) is hereby created to read:

"A non-GFCI protected, 125 volt, single phase, 15 or 20 amp single receptacle shall be permitted
for the gas water heater power vent when installed in a dwelling unit unfinished basement, unless
the manufacturer requires the power vent to be GFCI protected.”

(4) Section 230.79 (D) All Others. is hereby modified to read:

“For all other installations, the service disconnecting means shall have a rating of not less than 60
amperes with a main breaker.” :

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




(5) Section 250.52(A)(1). Section 250.52(A)(1), Metal Underground Water Pipe, is not
permitted as a grounding electrode in new construction. In existing construction, Metal
Underground Water Pipe shall be discontinued as a grounding electrode upon renovation or
upgrade of the electrical system or service, and shall be replaced with additional electrodes, at the
discretion of the Electrical Inspector, providing resistance as specified in NEC 250.56.

(6) Section 250.70(2) is hereby modified to read:

"Two (2) listed bolted clamps of cast bronze or brass, or plain or malleable iron."”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2014 Edition of the National Electrical Code were
filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s Office for public use,
inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at which the second
reading of this bill occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedaha
Missouri, this 1* day of February 2016.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




BILLNO. 2015137

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE V EXISTING BUILDING
CODE OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-144 and 10-145 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-144. Adoption by Reference

The International Existing Building Code, 2015 Edition, is the official existing building code of
the city and is incorporated herein by reference, except Appendixes and as amended in this
article.

Section 10-114. Amendments

The following sections of the International Existing Building Code, 2015 edition, are hereby
amended, deleted, or added as follows:

€)) Section 101.1, Title, is hereby modified, changed and amended to read as follows:
"Title. These regulations shall be known as the Existing Building Code of the City of Sedalia,

"o

Missouri, hereinafter referred to as "this code".

2) Section 103.1. Delete the words "code official" and insert: "chief building official." All
reference to the "code official" as stated throughout this International Existing Building Code,
shall hereby read "the chief building official."

3) Section 105.1.1, Annual permits, is hereby repealed in its entirety.

“) Section 105.1.2, Annual permit records, is hereby repealed in its entirety.”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2" day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Editions of the International Existing
Building Code were filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s Office
for public use, inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at which
the second reading of this bill occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1% day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1% day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




BILL NO. 2015-138

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 24, ARTICLE 1I FIRE PREVENTION CODE
OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

© Section 1. Sections 24-25 and 24-26 are amended to read as follows:

“Section 24-25. Adoption by Reference

The International Fire Code, 2015 edition, together with appendixes B, C, and D, of the
International Code Council, Inc., is the official fire code of the city and is incorporated herein by
reference.

Section 24-26. Amendments

The following sections of the International Fire Code, 2015 edition, are hereby amended, deleted
or added as follows:

(1) Appendices. The following appendixes are adopted in their entirety:
a. Appendix B, "Fire Flow Requirements For Buildings."

b. Appendix C, "Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution."

c. Appendix D, "Fire Apparatus Access Roads."

(2) Section 101.1. Amended by inserting: "City of Sedalia, Missouri".

(3) Section 108, Board of appeals. Amended by repealing section in its entirety and inserting:
"All appeals shall be conducted as set forth by division 3 of article VI of chapter 2, board of |
appeals, of the Sedalia City Code."

(4) Section 109.4. Amended by inserting: ". . . unlawful act, offense, or misdemeanor . . .
$500.00 . .. three months, . .."

(5) Section 111.4. Amended by deleting: " . . ., shall be liable to a fine of not less than [amount]
dollars or more than [amount] dollars."

(6) Section 111.4. Amended by inserting ". . . shall be liable to a fine as allowed by Section 1-14
of the Code of Ordinances, City of Sedalia, Missouri."

(7) Chapter 2 section 202 General definition. The term "Code Official” is hereby amended to
read fire chief or his designee.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




(8) Section 5504.3.1.1.3. Amended by inserting: "Storage of 'Flammable Cryogenic Fluids'is
prohibited except in Zoning District M-2, Heavy Industrial.”

(9) Section 5704.2.9.6.1. Amended by deleting first paragraph and inserting, "Storage of 'class I
and II liquids' in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited except in Zoning District
M-2, Heavy Industrial.”

(10) Section 5706.2.4.4. Amended by deleting first paragraph and inserting, "Storage of class I
and II liquids in aboveground tanks is prohibited except in Zoning District M-2, Heavy
Industrial."

(11) Section 6104.2. Amended by adding to first paragraph. "The storage of liquefied petroleum
gas is prohibited except in Zoning District M-2, Heavy Industrial."”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick -
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Edition of the International Fire Code were
filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s Office for public use,
inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at which the second
reading of this bill occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1% day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1** day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




BILLNO. 2015 —139

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE VI MECHANICAL CODE OF THE
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-174 and 10-175 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-174. Adoption by Reference

The 2015 edition of the International Mechanical Code of the International Code Council, Inc., is
hereby adopted and is incorporated herein by reference, excluding all references to the ICC Electrical
Code, the International Energy Conservation Code, and the International Private Sewage Disposal
Code and also excluding in their entirety all appendices. All references to the International Code
Council Electrical Code Administrative Procedures shall read and mean the currently adopted edition
of the National Electrical Code.

Section 10-175. Amendments

The following sections of the International Mechanical Code, 2015 edition, are hereby amended,
deleted, or added as follows:

(1) Section 101.1. Insert: "City of Sedalia, Missouri."

(2) Section 103.1. Delete: the first paragraph and inserting: All mechanical inspections shall be
conducted by the building safety department and the executive official in charge thereof shall be known
as the chief building official. All references to the "code official" as stated throughout this International
Mechanical Code, shall hereby read "the chief building official.”

(3) Section 106.5.3. Insert: in two locations: 80 percent.

(4) Section 108.4. Delete: the penalty provision and substituting. Any violations of the provision of
this Code shall subject the violator to penalties as provided in_section 1-14 of the Sedalia Code of
Ordinances.

(5) Section 108.5. Delete: the penalty provision and substituting. Any violations of the provision of
this Code shall subject the violator to penalties as provided in_section 1-12 of the Sedalia Code of
Ordinances and inserting: ". . . shall be liable to a fine as allowed by section 1-14 of the Code of
Ordinances, City of Sedalia, Missouri."

(6) Section 109. Repeal section in its entirety and insert: section 109.1, application for appeal. "All
appeals shall be conducted as set forth by division 3 of article VI of chap_ter 2, board of appeals, of the
Code of Ordinances, City of Sedalia, Missouri."”

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance be
declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the remaining
sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

1 certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City Clerk
and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick Regional
Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this bill was first
read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of November
2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Edition of the International Mechanical Code were
filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s Office for public use, inspection
and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at which the second reading of this bill
occurred.

1 also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s Office
and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the Boonslick Regional
Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this bill was read for
the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri,
this 1* day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




BILLNO. 2015 — 140

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE VIII PLUMBING AND GAS
CODE OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-227 and 10-228 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-227. Adoption by reference of plumbing and gas code.

The 2015 edition of the International Plumbing Code and 2015 edition of the International Fuel
Gas Code of the International Code Council, Inc., are hereby adopted and are therefore the
Official Plumbing and Gas Codes of the City of Sedalia and are incorporated herein by reference,
excluding all references to the ICC Electrical Code, the International Energy Conservation Code,
the International Private Sewage Disposal Code and also excluding in their entirety all
appendixes. All references to the International Code Council Electrical Code Administrative
Procedures shall read and mean the currently adopted edition of the National Electrical Code.

Section 10-228. Amendments to plumbing and gas code

The following sections of the International Plumbing Code (IPC), 2015 edition, and the
International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), 2015 edition, are hereby amended, deleted, or added as
follows:

(1) IPC and IFGC section 101.1. Amended by inserting: "City of Sedalia, Missouri."

(2) IPC and IFGC section 103.1. Amended by deleting paragraph and inserting, "All inspections
shall be conducted by the building safety department and the executive official in charge thereof
shall be known as the chief building official." All references to the "code official" as stated
throughout this Code, shall hereby read "the chief building official.”

(3)IPC and IFGC section 106.6.2. Amended by inserting: As per section 10-255, Fees, of the
Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia, Missouri.

(4) IPC and IFGC section 106.6.3. Amended by inserting in two locations: 80 percent.

(5) IPC and IFGC section 108.4. Amended by deleting the penalty provision and substituting.
Any violations of the provision of this Code shall subject the violator to penalties as provided in
section 1-14 of the Sedalia Code of Ordinances.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




(6) IPC and IFGC section 108.5. Amended by deleting: ". . . shall be liable to a fine of not less
than [amount] dollars or more than [amount] dollars."” And inserting: ". . . shall be liable to a fine
as allowed by section 1-14 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Sedalia, Missouri."

(7) IPC and IFGC section 109. Amended by repealing section in its entirety and inserting,
"Section 109.1 Application for Appeal." All appeals shall be conducted as set forth in division 3
of article VI of chapter 2, "board of appeals, "of the Code of Ordinances, City of Sedalia,
Missouri."”

(8) IPC section 305.4.1. Amended by inserting, "12" in two locations where [number] is shown.

(9) IPC section 608.1. Amended by adding additional sentences: "City of Sedalia, Missouri,
Ordinance 8798, approved September 7, 1993, provides for the control and protection of the
public potable water system of the city. The provisions of the ordinance are located in article III
of chapter 60 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, which takes precedent
over the provisions stated by this Code and are enforced by the water purveyor as per ordinance.'

|

(10) TPC sections 608.17 through 608.17.8. Amended by deleting these sections in their entirety
and inserting: Section 608.17, Protection of individual water supplies. All individual water
supplies (wells) are governed by the Missouri State Statutes and are inspected by the state. A
copy of the Missouri State Inspection Report shall be submitted to the chief building official for
all individual water supplies. :

(11) IPC section 701.2. Amended by deleting reference to "The International Private Sewage
Disposal Code," and inserting ". . . Missouri State Statutes govern private sewage disposal
systems and are inspected by the state. A copy of the Missouri State Inspection Report shall be
submitted to the chief building official for all private waste disposal systems."

(12) TPC section 706.3. Amended by changing Table 706.3 by deleting: The "Xa" shown in the
horizontal-to-horizontal column for quarter bend and short sweep fittings, and inserting
additional footnote, "d. Quarter bend and short sweep fittings are not allowed to be used in
horizontal-to-horizontal change in direction for all sizes of pipe.”

(13) TPC section 903.1. Amended by inserting: "six" where [number] is shown.

(14) IPC section 1101.1. Amended by inserting additional sentence: Surface water runoff
management is governed by article III of chapter 22 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of
Sedalia, Missouri.”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Editions of the International Plumbing Code
and International Fuel Gas Code were filed with and were made available to the public at the
City Clerk’s Office for public use, inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to
the meeting at which the second reading of this bill occurred.

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1% day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
- City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




BILLNO. 2015141

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 10, ARTICLE X, DIVISION 2
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE OF THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 10-412 and 10-413 are amended to read as follows:
“Section 10-412. Adoption by Reference

The International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 edition, of the International Code Council is
the official property maintenance codes of the city and is incorporated herein by reference except
as amended in this division and only to the extent that the provisions of the adopted code are not
in conflict with state law.

Section 10-413. Amendments

The following sections of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 edition, are hereby
amended, deleted, or added as follows:

)] Section 101.1. Amended by inserting: "City of Sedalia, Missouri."
(2) Section 103.5. Amended by inserting: Table T103.5.

3) Section 202. Amended to read: "RUBBISH. Combustible and noncombustible waste
materials, except garbage; the term shall include the residue from the burning of wood, coal,
coke and other combustible materials, paper, rags, cartons, boxes, wood, excelsior, rubber,
leather, tree branches, yard trimmings, tin cans, metals, mineral matter, glass, crockery, dust and
other similar materials and furniture and appliances originally manufactured for indoor use being
used in an outdoor setting."

(G)) Section 302.4. Amended to read as follows: "All premises and exterior property shall be
maintained free from weeds or plant growth in excess of eight (8) inches. All noxious weeds
shall be prohibited. Weeds shall be defined as all grasses, annual plants and vegetation, other
than trees or shrubs provided; however, this term shall not include cultivated flowers and
gardens.

Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of a property to cut and destroy weeds after 15
days have passed after service of a notice of violation, they shall be subject to prosecution in
accordance with Section 106.3 and as prescribed by the authority having jurisdiction. Upon
failure to comply with the notice of violation, any duly authorized employee of the jurisdiction or

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




contractor hired by the jurisdiction shall be authorized to enter upon the property in violation and
cut and destroy the weeds growing thereon, and the costs of such removal shall be paid by the
owner or agent responsible for the property.”

(%) Section 302.4.1, Diseased, Aged Trees, or Shrubs. To be added to read as follows: "All
premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from trees or shrubs that are diseased,
injured, aged, or any other condition that makes it likely for such trees or shrubs or branch
thereof to fall, whereby injury or damage might be caused to some person or neighboring
structure or improvement."

(6) Section 302.4.2, Trees or Shrubs Overhanging Streets and Sidewalks. To be added to read
as follows: "All premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from trees or shrubs or
any limb or branch thereof, that overhang any sidewalk, street, or other public place, or which
has become likely to fall on or across any such public way or place. Any such tree or shrub, or
any limb or branch thereof, described in this section shall be trimmed or removed by the owner
or occupier of the premises on which such tree or shrub grows in order to remove such
condition.”

N Section 302.8. Amended by adding the following: "The parking of vehicles on
unimproved areas of yards, as defined in section 66-1 of the Sedalia Code of Ordinances, is
hereby declared a public nuisance and unlawful. For the purpose of this section, unimproved
areas are those not paved in some manner, with such materials as concrete, asphalt, gravel, brick,
or cobblestone, so as to prevent the creation of dirt, dust, and ruts. Land covered with vegetation,
such as grass, or that portion of a paved area which exceeds 24 feet in width, is considered an
unimproved area.”

8 Section 304.14. Amended by inserting: May 1 to October 1.
) Section 602.3. Amended by inserting: October 1 to May 1.
(10)  Section 602.4. Amended by inserting: October 1 to May 1.”

Section 2. Severability Clause. Should any section, sentence or clause of the ordinance
be declared invalid or unconstitutional, such declaration shall not affect the validity of the
remaining sections, sentences or clauses.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

I certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the Office of the City
Clerk and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and Boonslick
Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at which this
bill was first read.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Read once by title by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri, this 2™ day of
November 2015.

Presiding Officer of the Council

I certify that at least three copies of the 2015 Edition of the International Property
Maintenance Code were filed with and were made available to the public at the City Clerk’s
Office for public use, inspection and examination at least ninety (90) days prior to the meeting at
which the second reading of this bill occurred. ‘

I also certify that copies of this bill were made available to the public in the City Clerk’s
Office and copies were provided for public viewing to the Sedalia Public Library and the
Boonslick Regional Library’s Sedalia Branch at least two business days prior to the meeting at
which this bill was read for the second time by title.

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Read for the second time by title and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri, this 1% day of February 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




PERSONNEL DEPARTMENT

February 2, 2016

Mayor Steve Galliher

Members of the City Council

Sedalia, Missouri

RE: Original Records Destruction

As per RSMo 109.250(4), City records that are on file in the Personnel Office and have met the retention schedule

will be destroyed in compliance with the guidelines established by the Secretary of State’s Office. The Personnel
Office does hereby request that the City Council authorize the destruction of the following documents:

- Unsuccessful Equipment Operator Applications — January, 2015 — Retention 1 year;

| hereby certify that the records described are no longer needed in the transaction of current business and no
longer possess sufficient administrative, legal, historical or fiscal value to warrant further keeping.

Method of destruction will be by shredder.

Sincerely,

/Mé > (2.

John L. Rice
Personnel Director

City of Sedalia * 200 South Osage Avenue * Sedalia, MO 65301
Phone 660-827-3000 Fax 660-827-7818

Pre-Cal mc”égendn ; eo'u'rrc#cg'errda-




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND ACCEPTING A SITE LICENSE AND CONSUMPTION COST
AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI AND KANSAS CITY
POWER AND LIGHT COMPANY (KCP&L), A MISSOURI CORPORATION, FOR THE
INSTALLATION AND OPERATION OF ELECTRIC VEHICLE SUPPLY EQUIPMENT STATIONS ON
CITY OWNED PROPERTY.

WHEREAS, The City of Sedalia, Missouri received a proposal from Kansas City Power and Light
Company (KCP&L), a Missouri Corporation; and

WHEREAS, under the proposal, the City of Sedalia, Missouri grants to Kansas City Power and Light
Company (KCP&L), a Missouri Corporation, a license to install and operate Level two Electric Vehicle Supply
Equipment stations on City owned property and the City will be responsible for the consumption costs for the first
two years as more fully described in the proposed agreement attached to this ordinance and incorporated by
reference herein.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA,
MISSOURLI, as follows:

Section 1. The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri hereby approves and accepts the site license
agreement by and between the City of Sedalia, Missouri and Kansas City Power and Light Company (KCP&L), a
Missouri Corporation, in substantively the same form and content as the agreement has been proposed.

Section 2. The City Administrator is authorized and directed to execute and the City Clerk is hereby
authorized and directed to attest and fix the seal of the City of Sedalia, Missouri on the agreement in substantively
the same form and content as the agreement has been proposed.

Section 3. The City Clerk is hereby directed to file in her office a duplicate or copy of the agreement after
it has been executed by the parties or their duly authorized representatives.

Section 4. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and approval.
Read two times by title, copies of the proposed ordinance having been made available for public inspection

prior to the time the bill is under consideration by the Council and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri this 1% day of February, 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1* day of February, 2016.

ATTEST: | Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




SITE LICENSE AGREEMENT

THIS SITE LICENSE AGREEMENT (“Agreement”) is entered into effective as of the 1% day
of February, 2016 (“Effective Date”) between Kansas City Power & Light Company (“KCP&L”), a
Missouri Corporation, with a mailing address at 1200 Main Street, Kansas City, Missouri 64105 and the
City of Sedalia, a Missouri limited liability company, with a mailing address at _ 200 S. Osage Avenue,
Sedalia, Missouri 65301 (“Host”).

WHEREAS, Host is the owner of that certain property legally described and depicted on Exhibit
A (the “Site”);

WHEREAS, KCP&L desires to install and operate Level two Electric Vehicle Supply
Equipment station(s) (together with all related utilities and accessories, the “EVSE™) in the location(s)
shown on the Site Plan on Exhibit B pursuant to the terms and conditions set forth herein.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual promises, conditions and agreements set
forth herein, KCP&L and Host agree as follows:

1. License. Host hereby grants to KCP&L a license to install and operate the EVSE station
in the location(s) within the Site shown on Exhibit B in accordance with and subject to the terms and
conditions of this Agreement. The EVSE shall include a vehicle charging station and related signage.
KCP&L (or its affiliates) shall (a) at no cost to Host, install all necessary electrical service, connections
and equipment to serve the EVSE, and (b) provide all necessary electric utility services to Host at the
EVSE. Host agrees to take reasonable actions to assist KCP&L with the installation of the EVSE. Upon
completion of installation of the EVSE, Host understands and acknowledges that ownership of the EVSE
shall remain with KCP&L.

2. Consumption Costs (Check the box that applies; if no box is checked, it is Host

Responsibility).

A. Host Responsibility (check here): X . Host shall be responsible for all kilowatt usage costs of the
EVSE for the first two years of the Term (as defined in Section 9 below). After the first two years of the
Term, KCP&L will deploy .a payment platform at the EVSE station(s) that will facilitate payment by the
end user and Host shall have no further responsibility for the payment of usage costs. Host represents and
warrants that it will not charge any third party for the consumption or usage of said power, electrical and/or
usage costs at anytime during the Term of this Agreement.

B. Account Holder Responsibility (check here): . An “Account Holder” is a tenant of the Host that is
currenfly a KCP&L customer and that pays the KCP&L electric bill at the Site(s) where the EVSE will be
located. If this box is checked, the Account Holder shall be responsible for all kilowatt usage costs of the
EVSE for the first two years of the Term (as defined in Section 8 below). After the first two years of the
Term, KCP&L will deploy .a payment platform at the EVSE station(s) that will facilitate payment by the
end user and Host shall have no further responsibility for the payment of usage costs. Account Holder
represents and warrants that it will not charge any third party for the consumption or usage of said power,
electrical and/or usage costs at any time during the Term of this Agreement.

3. Access. Host shall provide KCP&I access to and sufficient space for locating the EVSE
at the locations shown on the Site Plan, and also agrees to provide governmental authorities access to the
EVSE for any inspections and installation of monitoring hardware and/or software on the EVSE as
necessary for KCP&L to fulfill its reporting requirements to regulatory entities. Host will allow potential

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




end users access to the area where the EVSE is located in the same manner that it grants non-end users
access to the area.

4. Operation. KCP&L shall operate the EVSE in accordance with commercially reasonable
practices. However, uninterrupted service is not guaranteed, and KCP&L may interrupt service when
necessary to ensure safety or to perform maintenance. If any governmental license or permit shall be
required for the proper and lawful use of the EVSE, KCP&L, at its sole cost and expense, shall obtain and
thereafter maintain the same and shall comply with all of the terms and conditions thereof. KCP&L shall
promptly deliver copies of all such licenses and permits to Host..

Hours of Operation; Demand Response Procedures. Except as otherwise provided herein, the EVSE shall
be operated by KCP&L for up to 24 hours each day and made available to the general public. Further,
Host acknowledges and agrees that KCP&L will be utilizing “Demand Response” (“DR”) procedures.
The EVSE will display a message notifying the consumer of the various DR application scenarios. Host
acknowledges and understands that KCP&L utilizes such Demand Response options to optimize usage at
peak times, which could result in temporarily disabling the EVSE from electrical output or consumption
during the Term of this Agreement. Host shall not charge KCP&L or any other party rent or any other
fees to use the Site during the Term of this Agreement.

5. Consent: Permits. KCP&L shall not install the EVSE, including any utility service,
equipment or accessories or, after the installation thereof, alter the EVSE or any of its components in any
manner that requires architectural or engineering plans without first obtaining Host’s prior written
approval (which shall not be unreasonably withheld, conditioned or delayed) of the architectural and
engineering plans and specifications therefore. KCP&L shall not install the EVSE or any utility service,
equipment or accessories until all required municipal and other governmental permits and authorizations
have been obtained by KCP&L..

6. Marketing. The parties understand and agree that the EVSE will be KCP&L-branded.
KCP&L may publish and promote the locations of the Sites throughout the Term of the Agreement.
Host’s name may also be used in the initial launch of the program. Thereafier, neither party will make
any press release or otherwise formally publicize the EVSE on the Site without first obtaining formal
written approval from the other party. KCP&L has created marketing material which includes but is not
limited to logos, stickers, decals and signage made a part of equipment purchased or infrastructure
established; printed materials and other marketing and/or outreach materials, activities, and
websites. KCP&IL has logo usage and publicity standards that can be shared with host for their
review. With respect to any marketing efforts including but not limited to logos, stickers, decals or
signage made a part of equipment purchased or infrastructure established; or any printed materials or
other marketing and/or outreach materials, activities, or websites created by Host under this Agreement,
Host agrees to submit in advance any such marketing effort to review and approval by KCP&I,, which
approval shall not be unreasonably withheld, conditioned or delayed as outlined by the logo usage and
publicity standards provided by KCP&I..

7. Maintenance and Repair. KCP&L shall maintain the EVSE in good working condition
ordinary wear and tear excepted during the Term of this Agreement. Host shall maintain the common
area improvements immediately surrounding the EVSE in good condition ordinary wear and tear
excepted and will promptly notify KCP&L of any problems it is aware of related to the EVSE. Such
maintenance by Host of the immediately surrounding common areas shall include, but not be limited to,
pavement maintenance and snow removal services.

8. Term and Termination. This Agreement shall commence on the Effective Date and
continue in effect through December , 2024__ (“Term™); provided, however, KCP&L

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




has the right to terminate this Agreement at any time by delivering written notice of such election to Host,
in which case the Agreement shall terminate on the date that is 10 days after the Host’s receipt of the
termination notice. If KCP&L fails to perform any of its obligations or comply with any of the other
terms and conditions of this Agreement and such failure continues for a period of 15 days after receipt of
written notice from Host, Host may immediately terminate the Agreement by delivering written notice to
KCP&L. Upon the expiration or termination of this Agreement, KCP&L will remove the EVSE at
KCP&L’s cost and expense and restore the portions of the Site on which the EVSE was installed to a
condition similar to the Site on which the same was installed prior to installation of the EVSE ordinary
wear and tear accepted.

9. Liens. Host represents and warrants that (a) Host is the fee simple owner of the Site and
has good and marketable title to the Site and (b) the contents and terms of this Agreement are not in
violation of any other agreement entered into by Host with any other party. Neither party will allow any
liens or encumbrances to be placed on the EVSE or the Site. If any liens are placed on or filed against the
EVSE, or the Site as a result of any work or materials contracted by or on behalf of either party hereto,
said party shall cause the lien to be released of record within 15 days after the filing thereof. Nothing in
this Agreement shall be construed as empowering either party to encumber or cause to be encumbered the
title or interest of Host to the Site nor KCP&L to the EVSE in any manner. Each party shall indemnify the
other party against, and hold the other party harmless from, any and all loss, damage, claims, liabilities,
judgments, interest, costs, expenses, and attorney fees arising out of the filing of any such lien that is in
violation of this section.

10. Insurance. Each party agrees that it will at all times during the term hereof, at its own
expense, procure, maintain and keep in force insurance with an insurance company authorized to transact
business in the State of Missouri, a commercial general liability insurance policy covering: (a) the
operation and use of the EVSE (in the case of KCP&L) and (b) the operation and use of the Site (in the
case of Host), in each case affording protection in an amount of not less than One Million Dollars
($1,000,000.00) for each occurrence and Two Million Dollars ($2,000,000) in the aggregate for injury to
or death of one or more persons. The policy must include customary coverages for liability arising from
premises, operations, independent contractors and liability assumed under an insured contract. The policy
shall name the other party hereto (including said party’s parent, affiliates, subsidiaries, officers, directors,
employees, agents and assigns) as additional insureds whereby neither party may cancel or reduce the
insurance without first giving the other party hereto at least 30 days prior written notice. ~ Each party
further covenants to deposit with the other party a certificate of such insurance and the certificate of each
such renewal policy complying with the terms of this Agreement.

Further, unless third-party insurance coverage is required by applicable law, both parties
shall have the right to self-insure against perils and liabilities for which it would otherwise be required to
obtain insurance under the terms of this Agreement. If a party elects to self-insure against certain perils
and/or liabilities against which it would otherwise be required to obtain a policy of insurance under this
Agreement, then for purposes of this Agreement, such party shall be deemed to hold insurance against
such perils and/or liabilities in the minimum amounts of insurance which such party is otherwise required
to maintain under the terms of this Agreement. By so electing, such party shall be deemed to be self-
insuring against the perils and/or liabilities that are the subject of such claims.

11. Waiver. Host and KCP&L each hereby waive (to the extent of insurance proceeds
collected) any and all rights of recovery, claim, action or cause of action against the other, its agents,
officers, or employees for any damage that may occur to the Site, including but not limited to the EVSE,
and/or any personal property of such party therein by reason of any cause which is insured against under

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




the terms of any insurance policies referred to herein or self-insured, regardless of cause or origin,
including negligence.

12. Indemnification. KCP&L shall be liable for, and shall indemnify, defend and hold Host
harmless from, any and all liabilities, claims, demands, administrative proceedings, orders, judgments,
assessments, fines, penalties, costs and lawsuits, of whatever nature (collectively, “Liabilities™), arising
out of the negligent, willful or intentional acts or omissions of KCP&L, its express agents, contractors or
employees at the Site during the Term of this Agreement and/or a breach of any of the representations,
warranties, covenants or the terms of this Agreement. Host shall be liable for, and shall indemnify,
defend and hold KCP&L harmless from any and all Liabilities arising out of the negligent, willful or
intentional acts or omissions of Host, its agents, contractors, subcontractors or employees at the Site
during the Term of this Agreement and/or a breach of any of the representations, warranties, covenants or
the terms of this Agreement. Notwithstanding the foregoing, neither party shall be liable for or be
required to indemmify, defend or hold the other party harmless to the extent of any Liabilities that are
caused by the negligent, willful or intentional acts or omissions of the other party hereto.

13. No Consequential Damages. Except for indemnification obligations to third parties as set
forth in Section 14 of this Agreement, neither party shall be liable to the other party for any special,
incidental, consequential, punitive or indirect damages or loss of profit or business interruption damages
whatsoever.

14. Performance. Performance under this Agreement is subject to all valid laws, rules and
regulations of courts or regulatory bodies having jurisdiction.

15. Casualty. If all or any portion of the EVSE on the Site are damaged or destroyed by fire
or other casualty which materially and adversely affects the operation of the EVSE (any, a “Casualty™),
Host shall have the right to terminate the Agreement by written notice to KCP&L in which event the
Agreement shall terminate on the date that is 10 days after the date of Host’s termination notice and
KCP&L may elect to remove the EVSE from the Site. In the event of any Casualty which materially and
adversely affects the operation of the EVSE, KCP&L shall have the right to terminate the Agreement by
written notice to Host within 14 days after the Casualty, in which event the Agreement shall terminate on
the date that is 10 days after the date of KCP&L’s termination notice and KCP&L may elect to remove
the EVSE from the Site. ,

16. Assignment. This Agreement and the rights conferred hereunder shall not be assigned by
either party except with the prior written consent of the other party in each instance, and such consent
shall not be unreasonably withheld, conditioned or delayed.

17. Entire Agreement. This Agreement and the exhibits attached hereto contains the entire
agreement of the parties. No term or provision of this Agreement may be modified, amended, changed,
or waived, temporarily or permanently, except, in the case of modifications, changes and amendments,
pursuant to the written consent of both parties to this Agreement, and in the case of waivers, pursuant to
the written consent of the waiving party.

18. No Partnership. This Agreement shall not be construed as creating a partnership, joint
venture, agency relationship, franchise or association, nor shall this Agreement render KCP&L and Host

liable as partners, co-venturers or principals.

19. Governing Law. This Agreement shall be governed by the laws of the State of Missouri

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




20. Counterparts. This Agreement may be executed in any number of counterparts all of
which taken together shall constitute one and the same instrument. Facsimile and digital electronic
signatures shall constitute original signatures for purposes of this Agreement.

21. Notice. Any and all notices shall be in writing and addressed to the parties at the
addresses specified below or such other addresses as either party may direct by notice given in accordance
with this section, and shall be delivered in one of the following manners: (i) by personal delivery, in
which case notice shall be deemed to have been duly given when delivered; (ii) by certified mail, return
receipt requested, with postage prepaid, in which case notice shall be deemed to have been duly given on
the date indicated on the return receipt; or (iii) by reputable delivery service (including by way of
example and not limitation Federal Express, UPS and DHL) which makes a record of the date and time of
delivery, in which case notice shall be deemed to have been duly given on the date indicated on the
delivery service’s record of delivery.

If to KCP&L:

Kansas City Power & Light Company
Attn: Kristin Riggins

One Kansas City Place

1200 Main Street

Kansas City, Missouri 64105

Email Address: kristin.riggins@kepl.com

If to Host:

22, Headings. Section headings herein have been inserted for reference only and shall not be
deemed to limit or otherwise affect, in any manner, or be deemed to interpret in whole or in part any of
the terms or provisions of this Agreement.

IN WITNESS WHEREQOF, the parties hereto execute this Agreement agreeing to be bound by the terms
herein as of the date first above written.

KCP&L

Kansas City Power & Light Company

By:
Print Name:_Kristin Riggins
Title: Sustainability Products Manager

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Pre-CouncilAgenda

HOST:

By:

Print Name:
Title:

ACCOUNT HOLDER (both Host and Account
Holder Must Sign if the box in Section 2.B is checked):

Print Name:

Title:

CounciIAgenda




Pre-CounciIAgenda

EXHIBIT A
Legal Description of Site

[Insert here]

CounciIAgenda




Pre-CouncilAgenda

EXHIBIT B

Site Plan where EVSE(s) will be located within the Site

CounciIAgenda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING A QUIT CLAIM DEED WITH ASSOCIATED EASEMENT
FOR INGRESS, EGRESS, PUBLIC UTILITY AND RIGHT-OF-WAY PURPOSES FROM
THOMPSON HILLS INVESTMENT CORPORATION, A MISSOURI CORPORATION;
SYLVIA G. THOMPSON CHARITABLE TRUST, A CHARITABLE FOUNDATION TRUST;
AND CJ SEDALIA, LLC, A MISSOURI LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY FOR HOBBY
LOBBY DRIVE AND NINTH STREET AND ACCEPTING SAID STREETS FOR CITY
MAINTENANCE.

WHEREAS, Thompson Hills Investment Corporation, a Missouri Corporation; Sylvia G.
Thompson Charitable Trust, a charitable foundation trust; and CJ Sedalia, LL.C, a Missouri limited
liability company have asked the City of Sedalia to accept Hobby Lobby Drive and Ninth Street for city
maintenance as the streets have been built to City specifications; see attached letter from Thompson Hills
Investment Corporation and the proposed quit claim deed attached hereto, collectively as Exhibit A and
incorporated by reference herein.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, MISSOURI, as follows:

Section 1. The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri hereby approves and accepts a quit claim
deed for Hobby Lobby Drive and Ninth Street, which are new streets from Thompson Hills Investment
Corporation, a Missouri Corporation; Sylvia G. Thompson Charitable Trust, a charitable foundation trust;
and CJ Sedalia, LL.C, a Missouri limited liability company, as proposed on the attached quit claim deed
known as Exhibit A.

Section 2. The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri also approves and accepts for City
maintenance Hobby Lobby Drive and Ninth Street as said streets have been built to City specifications.

Section 3. The City Clerk is hereby directed to file in her office a duplicate or copy of the deed
after it has been executed by the parties or their duly authorized representatives and after said deed has
been recorded with the Pettis County Recorder of Deed’s office.

Section 4. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval.

Read two times by title, copies of the proposed ordinance having been made available for public
inspection prior to the time the bill is under consideration by the Council and passed by the Council of the
City of Sedalia, Missouri this 1* day of February, 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this this 1* of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




To: Gary Edwards
From: Ellen Cross

Date:  January 26, 2016
Subject: Hobby Lobby Drive and Ninth Street

Thompson Hills Investment Corporation has completed the streets Hobby
Lobby Drive and Ninth Street and has requested the City accept the streets

for ownership and maintenance.

I would like to recommend that we accept these streets as they were
inspected while being installed.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Thompson Hills Investment Corporation

OFFICE ADDRESS: MAILING ADDRESS:
906 THOMPSON BLVD. P.O. BOX 1546
SEDALIA, MISSOURI 65301 SEDALIA, MISSOURI 65302-1546

" TELEPHONE: (660) 826-4800
FACSIMILE:  (660) 826-5255

January 21, 2016

The Honorable Stephen Galliher
Members of the City Council
200 S. Osage

Sedalia MO 65301

Re:  Hobby Lobby Drive and Ninth Street
Mayor and Council Members:

Enclosed you will find a drawing showing the new streets leading to Hobby Lobby that
have been built according to City specifications. Also enclosed is a Quit Claim Deed dedicating
the same to the City. We ask that the City accept these streets for maintenance and suggest that

they be named as indicated on the drawing, Hobby Lobby Drive and Ninth Street.

If you have any questions with regard to this matter, please do not hesitate to call.

Sincerely,

Dianne M. Simon
Vice President, Property Management

Enclosures’

Pre-CouncilAgenda | CouncilAgenda




QUIT CLAIM DEED

THIS INDENTURE made on the /_hﬂ_h day of December, 2015, by and between Thompson
Hills Investment Corporation, a Missouri corporation; Sylvia G. Thompson Charitable Trust, a
charitable foundation trust; and CJ Sedalia, LLC, a Missouri limited liability company, of the County
of Pettis and State of Missouri, parties of the first part, and the City of Sedalia, Missouri, a Municipal
Corporation, of the County of Pettis and State of Missouri party of the second part;

ADDRESS: 200 South Osage, Sedalia, MO 65301

WITNESSTH, that the said parties of the first part, in consideration of the sum of ONE
DOLLAR AND OTHER CONSIDERATIONS to them paid by the said party of the second part, the
receipt of which is hereby acknowledged, do by these presents, Remise, Release and forever Quit-
Claim under the said party of the second part, the following described lots, tracts or parcels of land
lying, being and situated in the County of Pettis and State of Missouri, for public roadway and utility
purposes, to-wit:

A 50 FOOT TRACT OF LAND DEDICATED FOR PUBLIC ROADWAY AND
UTILITY PURPOSES THE CENTERLINE OF WHICH IS DESCRIBED AS
FOLLOWS:

BEGINNING AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF SECTION 6, TOWNSHIP 45 NORTH,
RANGE 21 WEST OF THE FIFTH PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, PETTIS COUNTY, MISSOURI;
THENCE SOUTH 04°12°13” WEST, ALONG THE RANGE LINE, 593.45 FEET; THENCE
LEAVING SAID RANGE LINE, SOUTH 64°54°40” EAST, 450.70 FEET; THENCE NORTH
25°05°20” EAST, 65 FEET; THENCE SOUTH 64°54°40” EAST, 125 FEET; THENCE SOUTH
25°0520” WEST, 245 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING; THENCE SOUTH 64°54°40”
EAST, 445.41 FEET TO THE WEST LINE OF LAMM DRIVE AND THE TERMINATION
OF SAID ROADWAY.

Pre-CouncilAgenda ‘ CouncilAgenda




THE WEST 37 FEET OF A 40 FOOT TRACT OF LAND DEDICATED FOR PUBLIC
ROADWAY AND UTILITY PURPOSES, LYING 20.0 FEET EACH SIDE OF THE FOLLOWING
DESCRIBED CENTERLINE:

BEGINNING AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF SECTION 6, TOWNSHIP 45 NORTH,
RANGE 21 WEST OF THE FIFTH PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, PETTIS COUNTY; MISSOURI;
THENCE SOUTH 04°12'13" WEST, ALONG THE RANGE LINE, 325.88 FEET TO THE
SOUTHERLY LINE OF U.S. HIGHWAY 50; THENCE SOUTH 64°54'40" EAST, ALONG SAID
SOUTHERLY LINE, 8.56 FEET; THENCE CONTINUING ALONG SAID SOUTHERLY LINE,
NORTH 82°43'EAST, 12.63 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING; THENCE LEAVING SAID
SOUTHERLY LINE, SOUTH 04°12'13" WEST, 274.82 FEET TO THE TERMINATION OF SAID
ROADWAY.

AND ALSO: An easement for ingress, egress, public utility and right of way purposes across the
following described tract:

BEGINNING AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF SECTION 6, TOWNSHIP 45 NORTH,
RANGE 21 WEST OF THE FIFTH PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, PETTIS COUNTY, MISSOURI;
THENCE SOUTH 04°12'13" WEST, ALONG THE RANGE LINE, 325.88 FEET TO THE
SOUTHERLY LINE OF U.S. HIGHWAY 50; THENCE SOUTH 64°54'40" EAST, ALONG SAID
SOUTHERLY LINE, 8.56 FEET; THENCE CONTINUING ALONG SAID SOUTHERLY LINE,
NORTH 82°43' EAST, 29.98 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING; THENCE CONTINUING
ALONG SAID SOUTHERLY LINE, NORTH 82°43' EAST, 3.06 FEET; THENCE LEAVING
SAID SOUTHERLY LINE, SOUTH 04°12'13" WEST, 286.51 FEET; THENCE NORTH 64°54'40"
WEST, 3.21 FEET; THENCE NORTH 04°12'13" EAST, 284.76 FEET TO THE POINT OF
BEGINNING.

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the same, with all the rights, immunities, privileges and
appurtenances thereto belonging unto said party of the second part and its successors and assigns
forever; so that neither the said party of the first part nor its successors or assigns; nor any other
person or persons, for it or in its name or behalf, shall or will hereafter claim or demand any right or
title to the aforesaid premises, or any part thereof, but they and every one of them shall, by these
presents, be excluded and forever barred, for so long as the same is used for its intended purpose of a

public right-of-way.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the said parties of the first part have hereunto set their hands and

seals on the day and year first above written.

THOMPSON HILLS INVESTMENT CORPORATION

By e a5 ;—;ﬁA

Adam B. Fischer, President

” /W-«o/’n/@%jéa/

Jdmes L. Mathews;gn

7 ' CO-TRUSTEES UNDER ARTICLE VII OF
William J. Shum THE SYLVIA G. THOMPSON
CHARITABLE TRUST

CJ SEDALIA, LLC by
THOMPSON HILLS INVESTMENT CORPORATION
Its Attorney-in-fact

BY oore S oS, X

STATE OF MISSOURI )
) ss.
COUNTY OF PETTIS )

On this _I_T_l"\day of December, 2015, before me personally appeared Adam B. Fischer, to me
known to be the person described in and who executed the foregoing instrument and acknowledged
that he executed the same in his capacity as President of said corporation, with full authority to do so
as the free act and deed of the Trust.

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my official seal at my

office in Sedalia, Missouri, the day and year first aboy itten. Z '
. @Me . b

Notary Public

My commission expires: Z z;ro : DIANNE M. SIMON
y P (é L ,7 Notasx Public - Notary Seal

E OF MISSOUR!
Benton County
Commission # 15541477
My Commission Expires: 06/01/2019

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




STATE OF MISSOURI )
) ss.
COUNTY OF PETTIS )

On this iH\ day of December, 2015 before me personally appeared Adam B. Fischer,
William J. Shumake and James L. Mathewson, to me known to be the persons described in and who
executed the foregoing instrument and acknowledged that they executed the same in their capacity as
Co-Trustees of the Sylvia G. Thompson Charitable Trust with full authority to do so as the free act
and deed of the Trust. :

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my official seal at my

office in Sedalia, Missouri, the day and year first above written.
~ -
. L—

- Notary Public :

- - ’ DIANNE M. SIMON
My commission expires: (é / t ( > o9 : Niotary Pubiic - Notary Ssal

i STATE OF MISSOUR!

) Benton County

: - Commission # 15541477

i My Commission Explres: 08/01/2019

STATE OF MISSOURI )
: ) ss.
COUNTY OF PETTIS )

On this Jjﬁ day of December, 2015, before me personally appeared Adam B. Fischer,
President of Thompson Hills Investment Corporation, Attorney in Fact for CJ Sedalia, LLC, a
Missouri limited liability company, known to me to be the person who executed this Quit Claim
Deed in behalf of said CJ Sedalia, LLC, and acknowledged that he executed the same for the
purposes therein stated.

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my official seal at my
office in Sedalia, Missouri, the day and year first above written. 2
. "

—

Notary Public

commission expires: (e [1 [ >0/ |
My commission expires / / CTATE OF MISSOUR!
E Benton County

: Commission # 15641477

t My Commission Expires: 06/01/2019

L,

DIANNE M. SIMON
Notary Public - Notary Seal

L RS

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




d|qep|ing paliwIad

ealy

NY1d 3LIS
TIVHIAO

(NOSSIN VITva3S
VOH HAGNYA ACW

A8H07 AHEOH

S102 Mg 92 Eva

on| " aiva ORI
| * 0 RV § WIS

pueedod

1217168009 sauoud
10669 OW ‘ellepag
Aemproig 153M 9104

\ e
-

AR T,

198J] YLON

‘. A = y
Joed] 1seq ry// /w

PAIGARLTIT IODIRGTN

Plute Rt A | ——

meva

VTG OVI e el e

FalyniTz

snautod TovAINS Eitiars _

aNz93

wraes
AuRDY AdfOU

CouncilAgenda

&

TS pLIOR

dVIN NOLLYDO A4S

iiﬂmc._. udis

| O S—————

Pre-CouncilAgehda




BILL NO.

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND ACCEPTING AN AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE CITY
OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI AND TIMOTHY D. EHLERS AND ANGELA M. EHLERS, HUSBAND AND
WIFE AND, TIM’S TREE SERVICE LLC.

WHEREAS, the City of Sedalia, Missouri and Timothy D. Ehlers and Angela M. Ehlers, husband and
wife, and Tim’s Tree Service LLC have had a successful three year agreement allowing the City access to the
Ehlers’ property to allow the City to grind up material to be used in the City’s composting facility and further
desire to continue this agreement for another one year period on the same terms as more fully described in the
proposed agreement attached to this ordinance and incorporated by reference herein.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA,
MISSOURLI, as follows:

Section 1. The Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri hereby approves and accepts the agreement by and
between the City of Sedalia, Missouri and Timothy D. Ehlers and Angela M. Ehlers, husband and wife and Tim’s
Tree Service LLC in substantively the same form and content as the agreement has been proposed.

Section 2. The City Administrator is authorized and directed to execute and the City Clerk is hereby
authorized and directed to attest and fix the seal of the City of Sedalia, Missouri on the agreement in substantively
the same form and content as the agreement has been proposed. :

Section 3. The City Clerk is hereby directed to file in her office a duplicate or copy of the agreement after
it has been executed by the parties or their duly authorized representatives.

Section 4. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and approval.
Read two times by title, copies of the proposed ordinance having been made available for public inspection

prior to the time the bill is under consideration by the Council and passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia,
Missouri this 1* day of February, 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this 1¥ day of February, 2016.

Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor

ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




To: Gary Edwards

From: Ellen Cross
Date: January 26, 2016
Subject: Agreement with Tim’s Tree Service

Timothy and Angela Ehlers own and operated Tim’s Tree Service located at 1501 N.
Ohio Avenue, Sedalia. This agreement gives the City permission to grind and remove
their material (yard waste) so it can be used at the City of Sedalia compost facility.

This agreement is for one year and is a renewal of the original agreement from
December, 2011.

The amount of yard waste needed to mix with the bio-solids produced by the City’s three

wastewater treatment plants is very large. This agreement gives the City access to
additional yard waste that is needed to produce the compost.

Thank you.

EWen

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




AGREEMENT

TIM’S TREE SERVICE LLC, TIMOTHY D. EHLERS AND
ANGELA M. EHLERS, HUSBAND AND WIFE
AND THE CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI
FOR PERIODIC TEMPORARY ACCESS TO 1501 NORTH OHIO AVENUE

THIS AGREEMENT, entered into this , by the Tim’s Tree
Service LLC, Timothy D. Ehlers and Angela M. Ehlers, husband and wife (property
owners) and the City of Sedalia, a Missouri Municipal Corporation and a third class City,
all of the State of Missouri.

WITNESSETH:

WHEREAS, Tim’s Tree Service LLC and Timothy D. Ehlers and Angela M.
Ehlers desire to enter into an agreement with the City of Sedalia to have its yard waste
ground into mulch and removed from their property;

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual representation herein, the
parties hereto agree as follows:

A. Tim’s Tree Service LLC and Timothy D. Ehlers and Angela M. Ehlers will allow a
contractor hired by the City of Sedalia access to the property at 1501 North Ohio
Avenue, Sedalia, Missour1 65301.

B. Tim’s Tree Service LLC will mark the material to be ground at the site prior to the
project being bid by the City of Sedalia and will not add or take away from the
material to be ground after it has been marked.

C. The City of Sedalia will be 100% financially reéponsib]e for the cost of the grinding.

D. The City of Sedalia will be 100% responsible for removal of all the ground material.

E. Tim’s Tree Service LLC and Timothy D. Ehlers and Angela M. Ehlers relinquish all
interest in the material once it has been marked to be ground by the City of Sedalia
contractor.

F. City of Sedalia will insure the road and area used during grinding process, on the lot

of 1501 North Ohio Avenue, will be returned to satisfactory condition which will be
approved by the property owners Timothy D. Ehlers and Angela M. Ehlers.

SECTION II - TERM OF AGREEMENT

The term of this agreement shall begin on April 1, 2016 and shall terminate on March 31,
2017. The agreement may be renewed on an annual basis, unless amended or terminated
upon mutual agreement and after written notification to all parties.

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Page 2

SECTION 1V - AGREEMENT AMENDMENT

The parties agree that no change or modification to this Agreement shall be of any force
or effect unless the amendment is dated, reduced to writing, executed by all parties, and
attached to and made a part of this Agreement. No work shall commence and no costs
incurred in consequence of any amendment hereto unless and until such amendment has
been executed and made a part of this Agreement.

SECTION V - AGREEMENT LIMITATIONS

It is understood that this Agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties
hereto, and there are no other agreements or understandings, implied or expressed, except
as set for the specifically in this Agreement.

SECTION VI - SEVERABILITY

If any one or more of the sections, sentences, clauses or parts of this Agreement, chapter
or section shall for any reason be held invalid, the invalidity of such section, clause or
part shall not affect or prejudice in any way the applicability and validity of any other
provision of this Agreement.

SECTION VII - TERMINATION

This agreement may be terminated by any party provided a ninety-day written notice is
provided to the other party.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this agreement in
counterpart, each of which shall constitute an original on the day and year first above
written.

CITY OF SEDALIA, MISSOURI

Gary Edwards, City Administrator
ATTEST:

Arlene Silvey, MPCC
City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




Page 3

Timothy D. Ehlers Angela M. Ehlers
Property Owner Property Owner

Tim’s Tree Service LLC

Timothy D. Ehlers, Manager-Member

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEDALIA, PETTIS COUNTY,
MISSOURI DECLARING A MORATORIUM ON DEMOLITION PERMITS ON OHIO
AVENUE BETWEEN MAIN STREET AND BROADWAY IN THE CITY OF SEDALIA. SUCH
MORATORIUM TO REMAIN IN EFFECT FOR NINETY (90) DAYS UNLESS EXTENDED OR
REPLACED BY AMENDING ORDINANCE OR RESOLUTION.

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri, has determined
that the National Historic District known as the Sedalia Commercial Historic District is an integral part of
the city’s economic development plans; and

WHEREAS, the National Historic District is vital to the realization of the City’s adopted
Comprehensive Plan, the Downtown Redevelopment Plan and the D.R.E.A.M. Initiative Plan; and

WHEREAS, the City of Sedalia has created and achieved considerable private reinvestment in
the downtown area through significant public investment in infrastructure to re-establish the economic
vitality of the area; and

WHEREAS, the City of Sedalia has created a Certified Local Government to assess and make
recommendations on the historic assets of the City of Sedalia; and

WHEREAS, the Certified Local Government Commission will be reviewing and forwarding
their recommendations to City Council concerning demolition permits in the next ninety days; and

WHEREAS, the demolition of buildings along Ohio Avenue may be detrimental to the integrity
of the Sedalia Commercial Historic District and the historic character of the district should be retained
and preserved; and

WHEREAS, it is in the best interest of the health, safety and welfare of the citizens of the City of
Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri, to protect property and building values within the City because of the
public and private investments that may be affected by such demolitions; and

WHEREAS, a moratorium on such permits is necessary to give the City Council of the City of
Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri, time to complete the comprehensive review and to develop and pass as
may be needed changes to the Certified Local Government and zoning ordinances and to the City Code of
the City Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SEDALIA, PETTIS COUNTY, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Moratorium on Demolition Permits on Ohio Avenue between Broadway Boulevard

and Main Street. There is hereby declared a moratorium on issuance of any demolition permits on any
land located on Ohio Avenue between Broadway Boulevard and Main Street in the City of Sedalia, Pettis
County, Missouri.

Section 2. Moratorium on Demolition Permit Applications. The moratorium declared in Section
1 of this resolution shall apply to the receipt by the Community Development Department or any other

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




department of the City of Sedalia of any demolition permit applications for properties located on Ohio
Avenue between Broadway Boulevard and Main Street.

Section 3. Moratorium Duration. The moratorium declared in the Resolution shall end in ninety
(90) days from the date of this Resolution unless extended by further resolution of the City Council of the
City of Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri or the amending of the Certified Local Government or zoning
ordinances or the City Code of the City of Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri, by ordinance or resolution of
the City Council of the City of Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri.

Section 4. Effective Date of Moratorium. The moratorium declared in this Resolution shall be
effective from the date of the posting of this Resolution on the agenda of the City Council of the City of
Sedalia, Pettis County, Missouri.

Passed by the Council of the City of Sedalia, Missouri this 1st day of February, 2016.

Presiding Officer of the Council

Approved by the Mayor of said City this this 1st day of February, 2016.

ATTEST: Stephen J. Galliher, Mayor

Arlene Silvey, MRCC City Clerk

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




| Office of the Mayor

TO: Members of City Council
FROM: Mayor Stephen Galliher
DATE: January 25, 2016

RE: Appointments to City Board

I would like to make the following recommendations:

New appointments:

Completing
1184 SE 185. William Ferguson’s Term
Knob Noster, MO 65336 Expiring 06-2017
Larry Bahr Completing
30712 Wright Road Ron Ditzfeld’s Term
Sedalia, MO 65301 Expiring 06-2019

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




LIQUOR LICENSE FOR COUNCIL MEETING February 1, 2016

New: Brian K. Egbert
Strikerz
2119 W Broadway Blvd
Liquor by Drink with Sunday Sales: $750.00

RENEWAL: Scott Hewett
Colton’s Steakhouse
4101 W Broadway Blvd
Liquor by Drink with Sunday Sales: $750.00

Joseph LeMaire

LeMaire’s Cajun Catfish

3500 W Broadway Blvd

Liquor by Drink with Sunday Sales: $750.00

Thomas White

% Loyal Order of Moose #1494
119 Winchester Dr
Sunday Sales: $300.00

Ann Grady

Woods Super Market, Inc
701 E Broadway Bivd
Taste Testing: $37.50

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




City of Sedalia
Department Bills 2-1-2016

Vendor Name Invoice Number Amount
A & B Auto Trim ' 26918 $ 240.00
Al's Portable Welding 4929 $ 35.00
Al's Portable Welding 4915 $ 614.00
Al's Portable Welding 4927 $ 1,507.00
AmericanTrailer & Storage 140286-0001 $ 28.00
AmericanTrailer & Storage 140286-0002 $ 28.00
AmericanTrailer & Storage 140286-0003 $ 28.00
Apco International Inc. 308210 $ 713.00
Apco International Inc. 324678 $ 359.00
Apco International Inc. 324683 $ 359.00
AT&T 116 $ 65.00
AT&T 0216 $ 82.18
AT&T 0216A $ 213.43
B & P Excavating 2675 $ 3,000.00
Bank of Kansas City 5090191 $ 400.00
Bank of Kansas City 5090192 $ 400.00
Bank of Kansas City 5090270 3 1,000.00
Bichsel Jewelry 001-133965 $ 314.00
Black Dawn Armory And Range LLC 554 $ $02.00
Black Gold Rubber Recyclers, LLC 9585706 $ 185.50
Blue Springs Winwater Co 050487.00 $ 378.00
Boone Quarries 213504 $ 1,719.29
Boone Quarries 214020 $ 90.45
Bothwell Regional Health Ctr 0116C $ 51.00
Bothwell Regional Health Ctr 0116D $ 266.00
Brownfield Oii Co Inc 140208 $ 6,151.12
Brownfield Oil Co Inc 140208 $ 3,618.37
Bryant Motor Co 132087 $ 51.17
Central Power Systems & Services 82369 $ 172.49
Champion Brands LLC 493578 $ 688.82
Champion Brands LLC 493579 $ 664.95
Charter Communications 0116-11 $ 442 .36
Charter Communications 0116-12A $ 80.00
Charter Communications 0116-12D 3 181.46
Charter Communications 0116-13 $ 212.69
Charter Communications 0116-19A $ 134.50
Charter Communications 0116-MUNI $ 215.00
Charter Communications 0216-12B 3 101.74
Charter Communications 1016-14 $ 80.00
City Safe & Lock Service 074070 $ 50.00
City Wide Fire Extinguisher Service 1612 $ 750.00
Clark's Tool & Equipment 170546 $ 43.10
Clark's Tool & Equipment 170770 $ 66.55
Clark's Tool & Equipment 170898 $ 50.30
Clark's Tool & Equipment 170969 $ 28.87

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




City of Sedalia

Department Bills 2-1-2016

Vendor Name
Clark's Tool & Equipment
Clinton Flower Shop
Commenco Inc.

Conrad Fire Equipment inc

Consolidated Electrical Distributors Inc.
Consolidated Electrical Distributors Inc.

Cooperative Workshops Inc
Custom Communications
Denise Bryant

Ed M Feld Equip Co Inc.

Ed M Feld Equip Co Inc.
Ellen Cross

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Empire District

Employee Screening Service Lic
Engineering Surveys & Services
Engineering Surveys & Services
Environmental Analysis South
Fedex

Filter Belts Inc

Fischer Concrete Service Inc
Foley Equipment Company
Foley Equipment Company
Foley Equipment Company
Foley Industries

Foley Industries

Foley Power Solutions

Fort Bend Services Inc

Fort Bend Services Inc

Fort Bend Services Inc

Fort Bend Services Inc

Pre-CouncilAgenda

Invoice Number
171020
123372
429994
504297
504565
8075-504695
44032
1601111B
0116
0289927-IN
029008-IN
0116

0116-12
0116-12A
0116-14F
0116-14H
0116-17A
0116-18
0116-19A
0116-20
0116-21
0116-61
0116-61A
0116-61B
0116-61L
0116-61M
0116-61N
0116-65
185580
ESS066180
ESS066181
134430
5-294-42607
MES87443
30110
PC440001960
PC440015131
PC440015183
PS5440014930
PS5440014968
R85724-01
0200434
0200434
0200434
0200676

Y A H P LS & O O H G H A DA B B BH R EF G A TR BB R R H H A A A B A £ & BN A A H 8 A & B B &H &

Amount
30.50
35.00
78.50
16.45
68.80

4.48
9,427.03
50.00
30.00
19.00
870.00
39.24
409.66
498.83
529.77
516.51
242.39
2,890.15
163.54
808.33
579.66
1,034.65
763.33
25.00
26.47
558.51
83.21
536.41
152.00
499.00
736.00
470.00
17.67
750.23
2,500.00
(19.19)
19.19
133.20
590.84
25.20
1,055.60
942.00
942.00
942.00
2,119.50

CouncilAgenda




City of Sedalia
Department Bills 2-1-2016

Vendor Name Invoice Number Amount
Galeton 1309166-00 $ 285.76
Galls LLC 004745459 $ 32.93
Gene Woolery 0116 $ 25.00
Gene Woolery 698304 $ 25.00
Hagen Vacuum Sales 077282 $ 429.99
Hillyard - Columbia 601895113 $ 373.61
Hillyard - Columbia 601903669 $ 173.23
Hillyard - Columbia 601895113-A $ (107.60)
IACP 1001180103 $ 150.00
IACP 1001180279 $ 150.00
IACP 1001181877 $ 150.00
IACP 1001184738 $ 150.00
IACP 1001187649 $ 150.00
IBT Inc. 6704820 $ 16.50
ldeal Tool & Mfg 137961 $ 150.00
I-Land Internet Services 1767325 $ 34.95
I-Land Internet Services 1767326 $ 3.99
I-Land Internet Services 1767327 % 5.00
I-Land Internet Services 1769858 $ 59.95
I-Land Internet Services 1769859 $ 3.99
IMKO Workforce Solutions 110471 $ 175.00
Insight Public Sector 1100457528 $ 2,792.97
Joleigh Meite 0116 $ 9.93
K & C Machining 8374 $ 109.20
KCP&L 0116-05 $ 157.79
KCP&L 0116-12 $ 371.22
KCP&L 0116-12A $ 795.52
KCP&L 0116-14 $ 19.53
KCP&L 0116-14A $ 19.55
KCP&L 0116-14C $ 114.55
KCP&L 0116-14D $ 95.08
KCP&L 0116-14E $ 54.76
KCP&L 0116-14F $ 160.47
KCP&L 0116-14G $ 28.68
KCP&L 0116-14H $ 661.90
KCP&L 0116-14M $ 19.62
KCP&L 0116-14N $ 40.03
KCP&L 0116-14P $ 30.87
KCP&L 0116-14Q $ 28.95
KCP&L 0116-14R $ 30.51
KCP&L : 0116-148 $ 32.65
KCP&L 0116-14T $ 30.45
KCP&L 0116-14U $ 20.73
KCP&L 0116-17 $ 25.06
KCP&L 0116-18 $ 897.01

Pre-CouncilAgenda CouncilAgenda




KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
KCP&L
Key Hydraulics
Key Hydraulics
Key Hydraulics
Key Hydraulics

City of Sedalia

Department Bills 2-1-2016

Vendor Name

Lea's Truck Service Lic

Leon Uniform Co
Leon Uniform Co

Inc

Inc

Lighthouse Uniform Co

Mailfinance
Main Street Logo
Main Street Logo

Mark's Mobile Glass Inc

MCi

Medallion Electric Inc

Mefford Vuagnaiux & Associates

Menards - Sedalia

Menards - Sedalia

Pre-CouncilAgenda

Invoice Number

0116-20
0116-21
0116-24
0116-24A
0116-24C
0116-24D
0116-61A
0116-61B
0116-61C
0116-61H
0116-61J
0116-61K
0116-61L
0116-61M
0116-61Q
0116-61Y
0116-65
0116-Comp
0116-Muni Bldg
0116-Muni Bldg
0116-Muni Bldg
0116-Muni Bidg
0116-Muni Bidg
0116-Muni Bldg
0116-Muni Bldg
0116-Muni Bldg
0116-Muni Bldg
0116-SL
16-39243
16-39252
16-39265
16-39282

8930P

369289
368352-01
78671
N5736586

2793

2809

181880

0216

102109

0116

05178

05690

S H H B B G OH & A A A BN B ) O H o gn Y B B B gn BB S R B A B 7 R B R 9 R A B 7 s B A B & & P

Amount
562.37
289.69

19.10
21.10
97.96
17.19
11,106.91
935.81
1,492.79
17.19
170.59
18.34
233.30
277.48
108.05
105.96
427.35
615.97
248.57
186.60
93.18
62.20
1,197.07
217.58
155.39
124.40
62.20
38,593.13
336.50
19.04
101.31
66.97
133.50
94.40
97.95
166.05
408.45
54.00
18.00
190.00
188.27
1,634.17
270.00
34.47
17.99

CouncilAgenda




City of Sedalia
Department Bills 2-1-2016

Vendor Name Invoice Number Amount
MRA Agri Services 96088 $ 52.50
Michael Turner Md 0116 $ 7,200.00
Mid-America Valve and Equipment Co. 160050 $ 2,101.04
Midland Printing Company 50789 $ 44.46
Midwest Laboratories Inc 789682 $ 385.49
Missouri Department of Corrections 6617 $ 892.50
Missouri Narcotic Officers Association 0116 $ 450.00
Missouri Narcotic Officers Association 0116A $ 150.00
Missouri Narcotic Officers Association 01168 $ 150.00
Mitchell1 IB18390438 $ 260.25
Moperm A-14475 $ 210.00
MSHP CJ Tech Fund 812HP $ 1,620.00
MSU Outreach 0116 $ 330.00
NAPA Of Sedalia Genuine Parts Company 411305 $ 49.54
NFPA 0116 $ 175.00
O'Reilly Automotive Inc. 0114-374995 $ 5.22
O'Reilly Automotive Inc. 0114-375671 $ 20.38
O'Reilly Automotive Inc. 0114-375721 $ 4.59
O'Reilly Automotive Inc. 0114-376287 $ 3.88
O'Reilly Automotive Inc. 0114-376292 $ 9.34
O'Reilly Automotive Inc. 0114-376745 $ 44.55
O'Reilly Automotive Inc. 0247-415471 $ 73.52
Otten Small Engine Service 181283 $ 115.11
Otten Small Engine Service 181485 $ 104.78
Pethealth Services Inc 7952634 $ 9.70
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds 63319 $ 27.00
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds 63320 $ 168.00
Pettis County Recorder of Deeds 63382 $ 27.00
Pettis County Title Co. PSR16-005 $ 75.00
Precision Precast 1017233 $ 166.40
Printlynx 115513 $ 314.31
Printlynx 115591 $ 297.29
Printlynx 115622 $ 18.00
Public Agency Training Council 202554 $ 790.00
Public Safety Center Inc 5645559 $ 77.71
Public Safety Center Inc 5648963 $ 152.71
Qtech Automation Inc 197 $ 1,460.00
Quicksilver Water 748910 3 26.50
Quicksilver Water 754691 $ 42.50
Rac-Jac Properties 0116-12 $ 6.50
Rac-Jac Properties 0216-61 $ 6.34
Richard Wertz 0116 $ 150.00
Ricoh USA inc 5040079083 $ 48.05
Roberts & Associates 09018322 $ 250.00
Schriefer's Office Equip Inc 283220 $ 36.00

Pre-CouncilAgenda

CouncilAgenda




City of Sedalia

Department Bills 2-1-2016

Vendor Name
Schriefer's Office Equip inc
Schriefer's Office Equip Inc
Screen USA Inc
Sedalia Pettis County United Way
Sedalia Rental & Supply
Sedalia Rental & Supply
Sedalia Starter & Alternator Service
Sedalia Starter & Alternator Service
Sedalia Starter & Alternator Service
Sedalia Veterinary Center
Sedalia/Pettis Co Dev Co
Sentinel Emergency Solutions
Sherwin Williams Co
SMC Electric Supply
SMC Electric Supply

Invoice Number
283445
283573
104568
0116
1708390
171140
22558
22640
22644

0116

0216

39320
7233-5
60214067-00
60214341-00

Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 603019
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 603081
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 603398
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 603737
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 603754
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 603797
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 603398-1
Smith Paper & Janitor Supply 603801
Sonequity Pest Management 124689
Sonequity Pest Management 124867
Spray Com Utilities Inc 8

Staples Business Advantage 3289354599
Staples Business Advantage 3289354647
Staples Business Advantage 3290022129
Staples Business Advantage 3290022278
Staples Business Advantage 3290022283
Staples Business Advantage 3290022549
Staples Business Advantage 3290022551
Stephen Galliher 0116
Tallman Company 5135650
The Sedalia Area Chamber Of Commerce 0116

The Spay And Neuter Clinic 740363

The Ups Store 3587

The Ups Store 3746

The Ups Store 3799
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc 032866
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc 0233065
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc 0233132
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc 0232762
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc 0232875

Pre-CouncilAgenda

€ A B A H G B R B h A R A 6 B H A B A Y BB & B8 & R B8 6 & BB A H & A A BB A BB A H B B €A B A &

Amount
12.38
180.69
1,956.76
40.50
852.16
60.00
154.00
91.00
750.00
79.60
10,416.67
1,040.24
7.39
149.48
9.37
89.72
60.92
239.69
44 .95
92.79
75.13
41.41
129.98
67.00
68.00
220,359.15
29.56
308.97
12.99
120.68
103.36
16.39
259.99
85.84
180.05
9.00
433.00
18.66
18.50
15.46
256.58
34.52
34.52
146.21
189.00

CouncilAgenda




City of Sedalia

Department Bills 2-1-2016

Vendor Name
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc
Trans-Central Suppliers Inc
USIC Locating Service Inc
Usps-Hasler
Viebrock Sales & Service
Viebrock Sales & Service
W & M Welding Inc
Walmart Community/RFCSLLC
Walmart Community/RFCSLLC
Walmart Community/RFCSLLC
Walmart Community/RFCSLLC
Walmart Community/RFCSLLC
Walmarn Community/RFCSLLC
Walmart Community/RFCSLLC
Walmart Community/RFCSLLC
Walmart Community/RFCSLLC
Warehouse Tire & Muffler
Waters & Company Inc
WCA Waste Systems Inc.
West Group
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Western Extralite Company
Wilson & Company Inc
Wilson & Company Inc
Woods Super Market
World Wide Technology Inc
Zoetis US LLC
Total Invoices To Be Paid

Pre-CouncilAgenda

Invoice Number
0232911
0232912
160207

0116

1951

1951

45508

00156

00683

00938

01206

01297

04913

06579

06939

07649
193645

0116

7650
833237435
S$5305839.001
$5305839.002
S$5307930.001
$5310358.001
S$5313567.001
63104

63105

490

4123796
9001250513

Amount
131.45
198.80

2,101.76
2,000.00
1,221.75
1,221.75
37.14
4459
55.30
69.76
80.47
18.96
150.00
97.60
95.24
82.50
209.00
3,000.00
819.58
361.63
31.96
(31.96)
13.94
21.07
34.07
782.40
1,557.00
13.53
384.00
268.00

A 4 B B P P P A B A R O B H N Y A £ R BB B & e & & B R e & &

401,728.58

CouncilAgenda




	PreCouncil

	Adenda

	PreCouncil Jan 19

	Council Jan 19
	Bill 2015-135

	Bill 2015-136

	Bill 2015-137

	Bill 2015-138

	Bill 2015-139

	Bill 2015-140

	Bill 2015-141

	Records Destruction

	KCP&L

	Hobby Lobby

	Tim's Tree

	Moratorium 

	Appointments

	Liquor License

	Dept. Bills


	PreCouncil Agenda: 
	Council Agenda: 


